
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 1

01/31/2004
CWP-1120036

FEE & EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONSRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,686.52

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Conference with Diane Miles-Kazimiroff re: 
operating reports, status, period, timing.

01/14/2004 CWP 0.20

144.00Begin Preparation of Second Fee Application 
exhibits.

01/20/2004 DK 1.80

184.00Continue with fee application exhibits.01/21/2004 DK 2.30
264.00Continue with fee application exhibits.01/22/2004 DK 3.30
496.00Preparation of fee application exhibits.01/23/2004 DK 6.20
264.00Continue with exhibits for second fee application.01/26/2004 DK 3.30
384.00Continue with fee application exhibits.01/27/2004 DK 4.80
312.00Preparation of fee application exhibits.01/28/2004 DK 3.90
176.00Continue with fee application.01/30/2004 DK 2.20

Total of New Services: 2,258.0028.00























































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 42

02/29/2004
CWP-3010308

GONZALES V. TOM DAHLENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,753.58

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Reviewing documents; Conferring with witness;02/04/2004 PDB 0.30
357.00Reviewing file and loan documents.02/17/2004 PDB 2.10

51.00Conference with Paul Barber re: defenses.02/26/2004 CWP 0.30
459.00Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel; 

reviewing new loan and lease documents; preparing 
correspondence to trustee; reviewing spreadsheets 
and court file.

02/27/2004 PDB 2.70

Total of New Services: 918.005.40



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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02/29/2004
CWP-3010308

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce
867.00PDB 5.10 170.00Paul Barber

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$918.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,753.58PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $53.36

CURRENT BALANCE:
$971.36TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,724.94



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 44

02/29/2004
CWP-3010309

GONZALES V. TOTAL CONTROLRE:
INFORMATION

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $700.35

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

102.00Review of file re: defenses, invoices, date of 
payments; Review of cases on defenses, new value, 
ordinary course re: facts.

02/05/2004 CWP 0.60

50.00Reviewed file and docket.  Meeting with C. Pierce re: 
settlement.

02/05/2004 MCG 0.40

75.00Reviewed preference calculation.  Drafted settlement 
letter.

02/05/2004 MCG 0.60

102.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: status; Review of 
settlement letter, file; approve for mailing.

02/10/2004 CWP 0.60

12.50Meeting with C. Pierce re:status of settlement letter.02/11/2004 MCG 0.10
136.00Review of file re: defenses, settlement; analyze 

amount of claim, probable outcome; Legal research 
for defenses.

02/20/2004 CWP 0.80

85.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
extension, settlement, defenses; Conference with 
William F. Davis re: same.

02/27/2004 CWP 0.50

Total of New Services: 562.503.60



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
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02/29/2004
CWP-3010309

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

425.00CWP 2.50 170.00Chris Pierce
137.50MCG 1.10 125.00Marisol Garcia

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$562.50NEW SERVICES:
$700.35PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $32.70

CURRENT BALANCE:
$595.20TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,295.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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02/29/2004
CWP-3010311

GONZALES V. TOTE CART COMPANYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $719.26

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

12.50Meeting with C. Pierce re: status.02/11/2004 MCG 0.10
15.00Meet with MCG, review status re: service 

information.re: scheduling.
02/12/2004 CMT 0.10

37.50Reviewed file and drafted Order Resulting from PT 
conference.

02/12/2004 MCG 0.30

Total of New Services: 65.000.50

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00CMT 0.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman
50.00MCG 0.40 125.00Marisol Garcia

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$65.00NEW SERVICES:
$719.26PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.78

CURRENT BALANCE:
$68.78TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$788.04



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
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02/29/2004
CWP-3010318

GONZALES V. WINDWARDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,279.73

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Reviewing documents; conferring with witness.02/04/2004 PDB 0.30
153.00Preparing discovery responses; reviewing file.02/05/2004 PDB 0.90
357.00Reviewing file and loan documents.02/17/2004 PDB 2.10
493.00Reviewing documents; preparing discovery 

responses.
02/18/2004 PDB 2.90

884.00Reviewing file and documents; reviewing points of 
law; preparing discovery responses.

02/19/2004 PDB 5.20

50.00Prepared Response to Request for Admissions02/20/2004 KW 1.00
646.00Preparing discovery response; reviewing file; 

preparing correspondence.
02/20/2004 PDB 3.80

408.00Reviewing correspondence and documents; preparing 
draft correspondence re status of case.

02/27/2004 PDB 2.40

Total of New Services: 3,042.0018.60



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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02/29/2004
CWP-3010318

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

50.00KW 1.00 50.00Kimberlee White
2,992.00PDB 17.60 170.00Paul Barber

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$3,042.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,279.73PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $176.82

CURRENT BALANCE:
$3,218.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$5,498.55

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 1

03/31/2004
CWP-1120036

FEE & EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONSRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $10,546.35

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

102.00Review of all bills re: saving as ASCII files; 
preparation for transferring into ASCII; email to Ron 
Andazola re: same.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.60

34.00Telephone conference with Ron Andazola re: status 
of electronic files.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from Ron Andazola re: ASCII files; 
Telephone conference re: same.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from Michele Lombard re: 
procedures; Telephone conference with Patrick Fry 
re: same.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.20

76.00Conference with Chris W. Pierce re: ASCII 
formatting problems.

03/11/2004 WFD 0.40

57.00Conference with B. Jacobvitz re: ASCII.03/11/2004 WFD 0.30
34.00Conference with Ron Andazola re: ASCII files.03/11/2004 CWP 0.20

119.00Conference with Diane Miles-Kazimiroff, Patrick Fry 
re: conversion to ASCII.

03/11/2004 CWP 0.70

34.00Telephone conference with Michele Lombard re: 
conversion to ASCII.

03/11/2004 CWP 0.20

56.00Conference with Chris W. Pierce and computer 
consultant re: ASCII formating.

03/11/2004 DK 0.70

34.00Telephone conference with Michele Lombard re: 
Michael Waite, contact in Albuquerque (ASCII files.)

03/12/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with Pat Fry re: conversion to 
ASCII.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with Michele Lombard re: 
ASCII; Left message with Mike Waite.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

03/31/2004
CWP-1120036

85.00Preparation of objection to motion to require 
electronic format; Conference with William F. Davis; 
Reviewed and revised same and prepared for filing.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Left message with Mike Waite re: ASCII.03/29/2004 CWP 0.20
95.00Review of Trustee ASCII requirements; Conference 

with Chris W. Pierce re: problem.
03/29/2004 WFD 0.50

34.00Telephone conference with Ron Andazola re: 
withdrawal of motion, extension; Conference with 
William F. Davis re: same.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 930.005.70

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

646.00CWP 3.80 170.00Chris Pierce
56.00DK 0.70 80.00Diane Kazimiroff

228.00WFD 1.20 190.00William Davis

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$930.00NEW SERVICES:
$10,546.35PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $54.06

CURRENT BALANCE:
$984.06TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$11,530.41

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

03/31/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

PREFERENCE ACTIONS 
ADMINISTRATION

10,188.0124,093.121120038 18,050.534,145.42

GONZALES V. ALLIED SUPPLY CO.
386.481,555.742030138 1,502.57333.31

GONZALES V. AMERICAN 
PROMOTIONAL

26.984,124.582030143 6,323.902,226.30

GONZALES V. ANDERSON NEWS
3,469.595,698.012030146 3,431.511,203.09

GONZALES V. AZAR NUT COMPANY
479.332,858.792030152 2,606.96227.50

GONZALES V. BUNZL USA
2,606.175,705.712030158 4,692.021,592.48

GONZALES V. C&H SUGAR
453.931,022.672030159 798.35229.61

GONZALES V. CAMPBELL SALES CO.
229.35832.232030163 602.880.00

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - DEMING
47.62973.752030164 1,052.05125.92

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - 
ENTERPRISES

1,529.266,245.072030169 7,258.482,542.67



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - SANTA FE
23.81597.292030179 840.13266.65

GONZALES V. DEAN FOODS, INC.
5,123.449,202.772030188 5,460.181,380.85

GONZALES V. DPI FOOD PRODUCTS
894.782,936.832030197 2,042.050.00

GONZALES V. FLOWERS - EL PASO
26.98768.732030204 741.750.00

GONZALES V. FOOD MARKETING 
GROUP

207.934,141.232030206 4,411.57478.27

GONZALES V. GERBER PRODUCTS CO.
101.58184.122030208 366.12283.58

GONZALES V. HOLIDAY CANDY
0.0080.972030209 524.32443.35

GONZALES V. HJ HEINZ
1,101.512,118.622030210 3,952.352,935.24

GONZALES V. HORMEL FOODS
53.961,420.002030212 1,527.93161.89

GONZALES V. INGRAM 
ENTERTAINMENT

7,332.8117,123.392030215 15,544.665,754.08

GONZALES V. JIMMY DEAN FOODS
297.591,507.712030219 1,448.20238.08

GONZALES V. KELLOGGS FROZEN
26.9835.982030224 9.000.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. M&M MARS
80.95832.472030230 1,291.16539.64

GONZALES V. MEAD JOHNSON 
FORMULA

53.961,879.762030239 1,825.800.00

GONZALES V. MINUTE MAID
355.931,173.612030242 844.1326.45

GONZALES V. MISSION FOODS
181.342,628.532030245 2,784.73337.54

GONZALES V. MOREY'S SEAFOOD
107.93277.242030248 331.20161.89

GONZALES V. REDDY ICE CORP.
208.322,790.522030272 2,716.58134.38

GONZALES V. ROYAL/JUAREZ DISTRIB.
374.971,194.142030280 1,122.85303.68

GONZALES V. S.C. JOHNSON & CO.
53.96497.322030281 443.360.00

GONZALES V. SANTA FE TORTILLA CO.
351.172,623.232030284 2,362.0089.94

GONZALES V. SEVEN UP/RC BOTTLING
1,540.363,079.952030290 4,543.613,004.02

GONZALES V. TOPCO
952.7113,661.722030300 12,798.9589.94

GONZALES V. TREE OF LIFE 
SOUTHWEST

271.801,855.552030307 2,572.57988.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. UNILEVER HOME AND
202.37452.212030311 1,494.721,244.88

GONZALES V. WISCONSINS FINEST
40.472,111.472030320 2,156.7185.71

31,575.18 39,384.33 120,475.88128,285.03Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
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BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

PREFERENCE ACTIONS ADMINISTRATIONRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $24,093.12

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conference with David Thuma re: hiring 
of Caplan.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.20

45.00Conference with D&P Furr's group.03/02/2004 ADG 0.30
45.00Review memorandum opinion in American 

Promotional case.
03/03/2004 ADG 0.30

165.00Review additional cases cited in American 
Promotional opinion and add to casebook.

03/07/2004 ADG 1.10

204.00Review of spreadsheets, trial dates, payments, 
history, orders in all preference cases re: trial 
preparation, witnesses;  Review of files re: same.

03/08/2004 CWP 1.20

45.00Review American Promotional opinion, determine 
which cases it would be helpful.

03/08/2004 CMT 0.30

105.00Review additional cases cited in American 
Promotional opinion (.5).  Draft memo to Chris 
Pierce regarding cases (.2).

03/09/2004 ADG 0.70

136.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: list of pending 
payments; Reviewed and revised same; Review of 
files re: same.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.80

270.00Revise spreadsheet.03/09/2004 CMT 1.80
30.00Meet with CWP re: payments.03/09/2004 CMT 0.20

240.00Draft spreadsheet re: payment plan.03/09/2004 CMT 1.60
15.00Meet with CWP re: spreadsheet.03/09/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with ADG re: payment spreadsheet.03/09/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with PDB re: payment spreadsheet.03/09/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Revise e-mail from David Thuma regarding General 

Mills settlement (.1).  Review response from Robert 
Jacobvitz (.1).

03/10/2004 ADG 0.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

34.00Review of emails re: General Mills; Conference with 
Anne Goodman re: same.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.20

45.00Update memo to Chris Pierce regarding  pending 
cases.

03/11/2004 ADG 0.30

75.00Status conference with Chris Pierce, Cynthia 
Tessman, Marisol Garcia, Paul Barber.

03/12/2004 ADG 0.50

45.00Review case list and respond to Thuma e-mail about 
General Mills settlement.

03/12/2004 ADG 0.30

15.00Telephone conference with Tom Walker regarding 
documents.

03/12/2004 ADG 0.10

102.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman, Anne Goodman, 
Paul Barber, Marisol Garcia re: status of all cases.

03/12/2004 CWP 0.60

62.50Meeting with C. Pierce, A. Goodman, C. Tessman, 
and P. Barber re: status.

03/12/2004 MCG 0.50

75.00Scheduling meeting.03/12/2004 CMT 0.50
75.00Update Spreadsheet.03/15/2004 CMT 0.50
15.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman and Marisol 

Garcia regarding cost bills.
03/16/2004 ADG 0.10

15.00Telephone conference with judge's chambers re: 
status conference.

03/18/2004 CMT 0.10

45.00Review status of pending cases.03/19/2004 ADG 0.30
90.00Revise spreadsheet.03/19/2004 CMT 0.60
45.00Status conference with D&P Furr's attorneys.03/22/2004 ADG 0.30

136.00Review of opinion on Nabisco case; Telephone 
conference with David Thuma re: same, appeal, facts; 
Conference with William F. Davis re: same.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.80

119.00Conferring with other attorneys re status of cases.03/23/2004 PDB 0.70
105.00Prepare memo for CWP re: cases.03/25/2004 CMT 0.70

51.00Telephone conferences with David Thuma, Jill 
Peterson re: status conferences.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

60.00Update memo to CWP re: cases.03/29/2004 CMT 0.40
75.00Update spreadsheet.03/31/2004 CMT 0.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 7

03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

Total of New Services: 2,678.5017.30

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
22.20Postage Charges03/01/2004

2.40Postage Charges03/01/2004
3.75Copy Charges03/01/2004

76.50Copy Charges03/01/2004
6.10Long Distance Phone charge03/01/2004
2.00Copy Charges03/02/2004
1.50Copy Charges03/03/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/04/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/04/2004

26.50Copy Charges03/04/2004
8.50Copy Charges03/05/2004
1.20Postage Charges03/08/2004
3.50Copy Charges03/08/2004
8.29Long Distance Phone charge03/10/2004

25.00Copy Charges03/10/2004
22.50Copy Charges03/10/2004

1.50Copy Charges03/10/2004
15.75Copy Charges03/10/2004

3.75Copy Charges03/10/2004
4.50Copy Charges03/10/2004
1.50Copy Charges03/10/2004
1.00Copy Charges03/10/2004
3.75Parking charge03/11/2004
3.85Postage Charges03/15/2004



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

3.00Telefax Charges03/16/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/16/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/16/2004

10.00Telefax Charges03/18/2004
3.00Telefax Charges03/18/2004
3.00Telefax Charges03/18/2004
1.50Copy Charges03/19/2004
0.37Postage Charges03/19/2004

68.75Copy Charges03/19/2004
95.83Postage Charges03/19/2004

3.00Telefax Charges03/19/2004
14.25Copy Charges03/22/2004

0.50Copy Charges03/22/2004
0.50Copy Charges03/22/2004
4.00Telefax Charges03/22/2004
4.00Telefax Charges03/23/2004
2.25Copy Charges03/23/2004
0.75Copy Charges03/23/2004
0.75Copy Charges03/23/2004
0.60Postage Charges03/23/2004
0.37Postage Charges03/23/2004
4.00Telefax Charges03/24/2004

32.00Copy Charges03/24/2004
0.25Copy Charges03/24/2004
1.50Copy Charges03/24/2004
3.50Postage Charges03/24/2004
0.37Postage Charges03/24/2004

16.00Telefax Charges03/25/2004



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

4.00Telefax Charges03/25/2004
128.00Copy Charges03/25/2004
128.00Copy Charges03/25/2004
128.00Copy Charges03/25/2004

0.75Copy Charges03/25/2004
153.60Postage Charges03/25/2004

2.58Postage Charges03/25/2004
0.37Postage Charges03/25/2004
5.00Telefax Charges03/26/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/26/2004

15.00Telefax Charges03/29/2004
4.00Telefax Charges03/29/2004

31.00Telefax Charges03/29/2004
4.00Telefax Charges03/30/2004

70.00Copy Charges03/31/2004
2.00Copy Charges03/31/2004
0.75Copy Charges03/31/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/31/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/31/2004
2.00Telefax Charges03/31/2004

95.83Postage Charges03/31/2004
1.80Postage Charges03/31/2004
0.37Postage Charges03/31/2004
0.60Postage Charges03/31/2004

Total of New Expenses: 1,311.23

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 4,076.4803/02/2004
Payment on January 2004 statement (Expenses) 1,026.0403/02/2004



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120038

Payment on February 2004 statement. 4,579.7903/23/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement (Expenses). 505.7003/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 10,188.01

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

675.00ADG 4.50 150.00Anne Goodman
1,125.00CMT 7.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman

697.00CWP 4.10 170.00Chris Pierce
62.50MCG 0.50 125.00Marisol Garcia

119.00PDB 0.70 170.00Paul Barber

$10,188.01NEW PAYMENTS:
$1,311.23NEW EXPENSES:
$2,678.50NEW SERVICES:

$24,093.12PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $155.69

CURRENT BALANCE:
$4,145.42TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$18,050.53



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030138

GONZALES V. ALLIED SUPPLY CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,555.74

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Email to Yvette Gonzales re: payment; Review of 
email re: same.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of file re: payment; email opposing 
attorney(s) re: status.

03/04/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
payment, status, question regarding settlement.

03/04/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
status of settlement, payment.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of file re: settlement agreement, signature; 
email to opposing attorney(s) re: same.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 

re: status.
03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
status conference.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 315.001.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 283.3103/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 103.1703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 386.48



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030138

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00ADG 0.20 150.00Anne Goodman
30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman

255.00CWP 1.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$386.48NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$315.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,555.74PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $18.31

CURRENT BALANCE:
$333.31TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,502.57



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030143

GONZALES V. AMERICAN PROMOTIONALRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,124.58

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

136.00Review of judge's memorandum opinion on trial; 
Telephone conferences with David Thuma re: same; 
Conference with D&P attorneys re: same, collection, 
mailing to other attorneys.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.80

34.00Review of email from David Thuma re: cost bill.03/02/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Conference with William F. Davis re:  trial, appeal, 

response.
03/12/2004 CWP 0.20

50.00Reviewed Memorandum in Support of Judgment.03/12/2004 MCG 0.40
136.00Telephone conference with David Thuma re: status; 

Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: cost bill; 
Review of docket re: filing of motion for new trial.

03/15/2004 CWP 0.80

68.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement offer; fax to Yvette Gonzales, David 
Thuma; Conference with William F. Davis re: same.

03/16/2004 CWP 0.40

15.00Meet with DK re: cost bill.03/16/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Meet with CWP re: cost bill.03/16/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Meet with CWP re: witness fees.03/16/2004 CMT 0.10

289.00Review of motion for new trial; Preparation of first 
draft of response; Legal research for same.

03/17/2004 CWP 1.70

238.00Reviewed and revised response to motion for new 
trial; Review of trial exhibits; Legal research for 
same.

03/19/2004 CWP 1.40

374.00Email David Thuma re: cases from post-trial brief; 
Review of email re: same; Reviewed and revised 
response re: same; continued legal research for new 
trial, grounds, discretion, evidence.

03/19/2004 CWP 2.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030143

459.00Continue to review and revise response; review of 
trial exhibits, testimony, judge's ruling, cases 
continued legal research for new trial, grounds, 
discretion, evidence; email to David Thuma for 
comments.

03/22/2004 CWP 2.70

85.00Telephone conference with David Thuma re: 
response; Reviewed and revised same and prepare for 
filing.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Review of email from Rachel Kefauver re: time; 
Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: cost bill.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

45.00Draft of Cost Bill.03/29/2004 CMT 0.30
45.00Review Motion and Response for New Trial.03/31/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 2,104.0012.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 26.9803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 26.98



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030143

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

150.00CMT 1.00 150.00Cynthia Tessman
1,904.00CWP 11.20 170.00Chris Pierce

50.00MCG 0.40 125.00Marisol Garcia

$26.98NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,104.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,124.58PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $122.30

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,226.30TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$6,323.90



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030146

GONZALES V. ANDERSON NEWSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $5,698.01

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

578.00Preparing pleadings; reviewing file.03/01/2004 PDB 3.40
136.00Revising order; reviewing file.03/03/2004 PDB 0.80

15.00Conference with Paul Barber regarding new value 
analysis.

03/04/2004 ADG 0.10

204.00Researching points of law.03/04/2004 PDB 1.20
136.00Preparing pleadings.03/05/2004 PDB 0.80

68.00Reviewing court file.03/08/2004 PDB 0.40

Total of New Services: 1,137.006.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 852.3203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 2,617.2703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,469.59



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030146

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00ADG 0.10 150.00Anne Goodman
1,122.00PDB 6.60 170.00Paul Barber

$3,469.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,137.00NEW SERVICES:
$5,698.01PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $66.09

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,203.09TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$3,431.51



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030152

GONZALES V. AZAR NUT COMPANYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,858.79

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

153.00Review of file, summary judgment response, 
documents re: Court's decision in American 
Promotional; analyze spreadsheets, defenses; Legal 
research for PACA defense, motion to strike, law of 
the case; 549 claims.

03/03/2004 CWP 0.90

30.00Determine status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Meet with CWP re: expert.03/29/2004 CMT 0.10
17.00Conference with Cynthia M. Tessman re: expert.03/29/2004 CWP 0.10

Total of New Services: 215.001.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 212.6803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 266.6503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 479.33



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030152

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

45.00CMT 0.30 150.00Cynthia Tessman
170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$479.33NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$215.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,858.79PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $12.50

CURRENT BALANCE:
$227.50TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,606.96



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030158

GONZALES V. BUNZL USARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $5,705.71

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

153.00Review of file, summary judgment response, 
documents re: Court's decision in American 
Promotional; analyze spreadsheets, defenses; Legal 
research for defenses, payments, demands, held 
checks; Review of held check spreadsheet, FedEx 
ledger.

03/03/2004 CWP 0.90

34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: experts.03/04/2004 CWP 0.20
75.00Draft responses to requests for production on 

insolvency issue.
03/07/2004 ADG 0.50

15.00Review deadlines.03/09/2004 ADG 0.10
270.00Telephone conference with Tom Walker regarding 

financial documents (.1).  Review financials at Tom 
Walker's office (1.7).

03/11/2004 ADG 1.80

30.00Review status, deadlines.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
34.00Conference with William F. Davis re: trial, discovery, 

theories, defenses.
03/12/2004 CWP 0.20

40.00Prepare Certificate of Mailing, file electronically.03/15/2004 JG 0.80
180.00Review financial documents for production to 

defendant.
03/15/2004 ADG 1.20

45.00Draft response to Second Requests for Production.03/15/2004 ADG 0.30
30.00Draft memo to Chris Pierce regarding production of 

documents.
03/15/2004 ADG 0.20

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding documents 
being produced.

03/15/2004 ADG 0.20

34.00Review of file re: Rachel's analysis; Letter to 
opposing attorney(s) re: completion, deposition.

03/15/2004 CWP 0.20

170.00Conferences with Anne Goodman re: response to 
defendant's 2d RFP; Reviewed and revised same; 
Preparation for service.

03/15/2004 CWP 1.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030158

170.00Review of documents produced, compare with 
defendant's documents; Conference with Anne 
Goodman re: newly discovered financials, 
production, trial, discovery requests re: insolvency, 
best interest test.

03/16/2004 CWP 1.00

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
depositions, mediation.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
deposition dates; Telephone conference with Rachel 
Kefauver re: same.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.20

25.00Prepare Amended Notice of Deposition of Matt 
Wenthold.

03/30/2004 JG 0.50

51.00Review of notice of deposition for Rachel Kefauver; 
Preparation of notice of deposition for Matt 
Wenthold.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
possible expert witness; Review of file re: same.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 1,505.0010.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,776.8603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 829.3103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,606.17



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030158

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

675.00ADG 4.50 150.00Anne Goodman
765.00CWP 4.50 170.00Chris Pierce

65.00JG 1.30 50.00Jina Garcia

$2,606.17NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,505.00NEW SERVICES:
$5,705.71PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $87.48

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,592.48TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$4,692.02



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030159

GONZALES V. C&H SUGARRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,022.67

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

136.00Conference with Jina Garcia,  paralegal re: 
preparation of settlement motion, agreement, notice; 
Reviewed and revised same and prepare for filing; 
Review of file re: terms, status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.80

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 217.001.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 426.9503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 26.9803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 453.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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ACC'T NO.:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030159

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
187.00CWP 1.10 170.00Chris Pierce

$453.93NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$217.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,022.67PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $12.61

CURRENT BALANCE:
$229.61TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$798.35



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030163

GONZALES V. CAMPBELL SALES CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $832.23

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 229.3503/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 229.35

$229.35NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$832.23PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$602.88



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030164

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - DEMINGRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $973.75

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

119.00Review of documents from CCE on marketing 
agreement; Legal research for new value defense; 
analyze spreadsheets re: claims, defenses.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.70

Total of New Services: 119.000.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 47.6203/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 47.62

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

119.00CWP 0.70 170.00Chris Pierce

$47.62NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$119.00NEW SERVICES:
$973.75PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $6.92

CURRENT BALANCE:
$125.92TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,052.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030169

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - ENTERPRISESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $6,245.07

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

187.00Review of case law on new value; Review of 
documents from opposing attorney(s) on ordinary 
course, marketing agreement; analyze spreadsheets 
re: claims, defenses.

03/01/2004 CWP 1.10

17.00Email Court's opinion to opposing attorney(s).03/04/2004 CWP 0.10
136.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) regarding 

discovery requests; Conference with Anne Goodman 
re: same.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.80

30.00Review status, deadlines.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
45.00Review meet and confer letter from opposing 

counsel.
03/11/2004 ADG 0.30

15.00Status conference with Chris Pierce.03/16/2004 ADG 0.10
360.00Initial review of Defendants' documents.03/18/2004 ADG 2.40
153.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: telephone 

conference, discovery responses; Review of 
documents re: same; emails to opposing attorney(s) 
and review emails re: same.

03/18/2004 CWP 0.90

17.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: summary 
judgment, legal research on marketing agreement 
payment.

03/19/2004 CWP 0.10

210.00Review defendants' documents.03/19/2004 ADG 1.40
30.00Conference with Chris Pierce.03/19/2004 ADG 0.20

150.00Review meet and confer letter prior to conference call 
(.2).  Conference call with  Chris Pierce, and 
opposing counsel William DuPre and Catharine 
Harrison (.8).

03/19/2004 ADG 1.00

15.00Follow-up conference with Chris Pierce (.1).03/19/2004 ADG 0.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030169

210.00Draft letter to opposing counsel regarding conference 
call and further action.

03/19/2004 ADG 1.40

136.00Conference call with W. Dupre, C. Harrison and 
Anne D. Goodman.

03/19/2004 CWP 0.80

90.00Review defendants' documents relating to advertising 
program.

03/24/2004 ADG 0.60

187.00Legal research for treatment of $1,000,000 marketing 
payment; Review of documents re: same.

03/24/2004 CWP 1.10

330.00Review documents pertaining to advertising program.03/25/2004 ADG 2.20
51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: letter to 

opposing attorney(s) on discovery.
03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
discovery.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 2,403.0015.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,015.8003/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 513.4603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,529.26



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030169

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,485.00ADG 9.90 150.00Anne Goodman
918.00CWP 5.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,529.26NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,403.00NEW SERVICES:
$6,245.07PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $139.67

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,542.67TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$7,258.48



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030179

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - SANTA FERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $597.29

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

102.00Review of documents from CCE on marketing 
agreement; Legal research for new value defense; 
analyze spreadsheets re: claims, defenses.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.60

30.00Determine status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
120.00Analyze; determine what additional material is 

needed.
03/19/2004 CMT 0.80

Total of New Services: 252.001.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 23.81



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030179

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

150.00CMT 1.00 150.00Cynthia Tessman
102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$23.81NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$252.00NEW SERVICES:
$597.29PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $14.65

CURRENT BALANCE:
$266.65TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$840.13



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030188

GONZALES V. DEAN FOODS, INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $9,202.77

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Reviewed and revised witness list; authorize for 
filing.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.30

153.00Review of spreadsheets, depositions re: claims; 
Review of documents, file re: post-petition claims;  
Reviewed and revised discovery, update requests, 
prepare for new discovery, deposition requests.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.90

51.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
extension; Telephone conference with opposing 
attorney(s) re: same; email approval.

03/03/2004 CWP 0.30

17.00Email Court's opinion to opposing attorney(s).03/04/2004 CWP 0.10
34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 

witness lists, deadline; email opposing attorney(s) re: 
same.

03/06/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status, deadlines.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
187.00Review of file, documents, discovery, spreadsheets, 

exhibits; Legal research for new value, ordinary 
course; Review of deposition testimony; Reviewed 
and revised settlement letter.

03/11/2004 CWP 1.10

170.00Reviewed and revised settlement letter; Review of 
emails from Rachel, spreadsheets; Review of judge's 
opinion re: ordinary course; approve letter for 
mailing.

03/11/2004 CWP 1.00

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding settlement 
letter.

03/12/2004 ADG 0.20

136.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
discovery; Telephone conference with opposing 
attorney(s) re: same.

03/12/2004 CWP 0.80

34.00Review of email re: extension; email response.03/19/2004 CWP 0.20
15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding extension 

order.
03/25/2004 ADG 0.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030188

15.00Review e-mail from opposing counsel regarding 
extensions.

03/25/2004 ADG 0.10

105.00Review prior deadlines and discovery responses 
received to date from defendants.

03/25/2004 ADG 0.70

45.00Prepare extension order.03/25/2004 ADG 0.30
30.00Telephone conference with Jill Petersen regarding 

continued date for final pretrial conference.
03/25/2004 ADG 0.20

68.00Review of emails from opposing attorney(s) re: 
discovery, deadlines; Conference with Anne 
Goodman re: same.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.40

15.00Review e-mail from Chris Pierce regarding extension 
order.

03/26/2004 ADG 0.10

51.00Review of scheduling order; fax to opposing 
attorney(s); Conference with Anne Goodman re: 
same.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
witness list; Reviewed and revised same.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Email opposing attorney(s) re: amended order.03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 1,305.007.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 4,057.6403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,065.8003/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 5,123.44



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030188

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

285.00ADG 1.90 150.00Anne Goodman
1,020.00CWP 6.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$5,123.44NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,305.00NEW SERVICES:
$9,202.77PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $75.85

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,380.85TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$5,460.18



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030197

GONZALES V. DPI FOOD PRODUCTSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,936.83

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 94.4403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 800.3403/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 894.78

$894.78NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$2,936.83PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,042.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030204

GONZALES V. FLOWERS - EL PASORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $768.73

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 26.9803/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 26.98

$26.98NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$768.73PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$741.75



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030206

GONZALES V. FOOD MARKETING GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,141.23

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

187.00Review of documents from defendant on new value, 
ordinary course, wire transfers;  Legal research for 
ordinary course defense, cases cited by Court in 
American Promotional decision;  analyze 
spreadsheets, summary judgment exhibits re: claims, 
defenses.

03/02/2004 CWP 1.10

85.00Review of file re: trial, exhibits, experts; Review of 
case law re: defendant's exhibits, summary judgment; 
Legal research for motion to strike.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.50

30.00Determine status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
150.00Analyze; determine what is needed; status of MSJ 

and depositions.
03/19/2004 CMT 1.00

Total of New Services: 452.002.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 76.1903/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 131.7403/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 207.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030206

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

180.00CMT 1.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
272.00CWP 1.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$207.93NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$452.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,141.23PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $26.27

CURRENT BALANCE:
$478.27TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$4,411.57



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030208

GONZALES V. GERBER PRODUCTS CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $184.12

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of message from Susan MacTye re: status; 
reviewed file; Left message with same.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Telephone conference with Susan MacTye re: 
settlement, status; email re: facts.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Emails to and from Susan MacTye re: w-9, payment 
information, settlement status.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of emails from Susan MacTye re: settlement, 
payment, orders.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 268.001.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 101.5803/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 101.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030208

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
238.00CWP 1.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$101.58NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$268.00NEW SERVICES:
$184.12PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $15.58

CURRENT BALANCE:
$283.58TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$366.12



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 41

03/31/2004
CWP-2030209

GONZALES V. HOLIDAY CANDYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $80.97

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: status of settlement.03/10/2004 CWP 0.20
100.00Prepare Motion to Approve Settlement, Notice of 

Deadline to File Objections to Motion, Order 
Approving Settlement, Order Dismissing Adversary 
Complaint.

03/22/2004 JG 2.00

34.00Letter to Yvette Gonzales re: signature on release.03/22/2004 CWP 0.20
136.00Conference with Jina Garcia,  paralegal re: 

preparation of settlement motion, notice, orders; 
Reviewed and revised same and prepare for filing; 
Review of file re: terms, status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.80

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of release from Yvette Gonzales; Letter to 
opposing attorney(s).

03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 419.003.90



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030209

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
289.00CWP 1.70 170.00Chris Pierce
100.00JG 2.00 50.00Jina Garcia

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$419.00NEW SERVICES:
$80.97PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $24.35

CURRENT BALANCE:
$443.35TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$524.32



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030210

GONZALES V. HJ HEINZRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,118.62

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

136.00Review of file, documents re: Court's decision in 
American Promotional; analyze spreadsheets, 
defenses; Legal research for defenses, payments prior 
to terms during preference period.

03/03/2004 CWP 0.80

17.00Email Court's opinion to opposing attorney(s).03/04/2004 CWP 0.10
51.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 

response to Court's opinion, trustee's renewed 
demand.

03/04/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review status, deadlines.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
136.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 

settlement.
03/12/2004 CWP 0.80

153.00Review of file, documents, judgment re: settlement 
discussions, discovery.

03/12/2004 CWP 0.90

204.00Email to Rachel Kefauver re: updates on 
spreadsheets; Review of emails, spreadsheets re: 
same; Preparation of first draft of settlement letter; 
Review of case law re: defenses.

03/17/2004 CWP 1.20

15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding extensions of 
deadlines.

03/22/2004 ADG 0.10

30.00Telephone conference with Mary Anderson at Judge 
Starzynki's chambers regarding date of continued 
pretrial conference.

03/22/2004 ADG 0.20

30.00Prepare extension order.03/22/2004 ADG 0.20
90.00Review preference and new value calculations.03/22/2004 ADG 0.60

255.00Research case law on amendment issue.03/22/2004 ADG 1.70
165.00Prepare new value calculations to address revised 

check amounts.
03/22/2004 ADG 1.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 44

03/31/2004
CWP-2030210

51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: scheduling 
order; Reviewed and revised same and fax to 
opposing attorney(s).

03/22/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of fax from opposing attorney(s) re: order.03/22/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding motion to 

amend complaint.
03/23/2004 ADG 0.20

60.00Draft e-mail to Rachel Kefauver regarding revised 
preference calculation.

03/23/2004 ADG 0.40

85.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: spreadsheets, 
damages, response, status; Telephone conference 
with Rachel Kefauver re: same; Review of 
spreadsheets.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.50

15.00Review e-mail from Rachel Kefauver regarding 
spreadsheet request.

03/24/2004 ADG 0.10

105.00Work on motion to amend complaint.03/24/2004 ADG 0.70
255.00Review research on preference claim amendments, 

draft motion to clarify or amend.
03/25/2004 ADG 1.70

75.00Review revised spreadsheets received from Rachel 
Kefauver (.4).  Draft return e-mail to Rachel 
Kefauver regarding payment amounts (.1).

03/26/2004 ADG 0.50

60.00Review return e-mail and attached additional 
revisions to spreadsheets.

03/26/2004 ADG 0.40

120.00Prepare first amended complaint (.6).   Revise motion 
to clarify or amend (.2).

03/27/2004 ADG 0.80

45.00Review draft settlement letter and amended 
complaint, conference with Chris Pierce.

03/29/2004 ADG 0.30

493.00Conference with Anne Goodman; Review of files, 
new spreadsheets, damages, calculations; Preparation 
of letter to opposing attorney(s) re: settlement; 
Reviewed and revised scheduling order; Reviewed 
and revised letter, Motion to Clarify; approve for 
mailing.

03/29/2004 CWP 2.90

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: fax, 
order; Reviewed and revised order and email to 
Court.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 45

03/31/2004
CWP-2030210

Total of New Services: 2,774.0017.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 311.0903/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 790.4203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,101.51

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,380.00ADG 9.20 150.00Anne Goodman
1,394.00CWP 8.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,101.51NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,774.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,118.62PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $161.24

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,935.24TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$3,952.35



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030212

GONZALES V. HORMEL FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,420.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: approval of dismissal order; Reviewed and revised 
same and email to court.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal.03/23/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: vacating status 

conference.
03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

0.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 153.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 53.9603/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 53.96



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030212

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00CMT 0.20 0.00Cynthia Tessman
153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$53.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$153.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,420.00PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.89

CURRENT BALANCE:
$161.89TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,527.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 48

03/31/2004
CWP-2030215

GONZALES V. INGRAM ENTERTAINMENTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $17,123.39

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

306.00Preparing correspondence; preparing for deposition.03/02/2004 PDB 1.80
646.00Telephone call to expert witness; preparing for 

depositions; reviewing correspondence and revising 
order re discovery.

03/03/2004 PDB 3.80

204.00Researching points of law.03/04/2004 PDB 1.20
187.00Preparing for depositions03/08/2004 PDB 1.10

15.00Copied documents and sent same to Walter Doyle for 
his review with cover letter

03/10/2004 KW 0.30

578.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel's legal 
assistant; telephone conversation with witness; 
reviewing correspondence from accountant; 
preparing for depositions.

03/12/2004 PDB 3.40

357.00Reviewing correspondence; reviewing file; 
conferring with expert witness; reviewing pleadings.

03/15/2004 PDB 2.10

34.00Conference with Paul Barber re: Buz Doyle, 
deposition; Conference with Buz Doyle re: same.

03/16/2004 CWP 0.20

391.00Telephone conversation with accountant; telephone 
conversation with witness; preparing for depositions.

03/16/2004 PDB 2.30

1,309.00Preparing for and appearing at depositions.03/17/2004 PDB 7.70
816.00Reviewing correspondence; preparing for and 

appearing at deposition of expert witness; conferring 
with expert witness.

03/18/2004 PDB 4.80

561.00Reviewing pleadings; preparing for trial.03/19/2004 PDB 3.30
34.00Reviewing correspondence.03/24/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 5,438.0032.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 49

03/31/2004
CWP-2030215

Payment on January 2004 statement. 5,444.8503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,887.9603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 7,332.81

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce
15.00KW 0.30 50.00Kimberlee White

5,389.00PDB 31.70 170.00Paul Barber

$7,332.81NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$5,438.00NEW SERVICES:
$17,123.39PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $316.08

CURRENT BALANCE:
$5,754.08TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$15,544.66



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 50

03/31/2004
CWP-2030219

GONZALES V. JIMMY DEAN FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,507.71

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Review e-mail from Buchman.03/12/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Respond to e-mail.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Review e-mail reply.03/12/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00E-mail to Buchman re: status.03/29/2004 CMT 0.20
90.00Draft order approving settlement.03/29/2004 CMT 0.60
15.00E-mail Buchman with order.03/29/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Revise order.03/29/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 225.001.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 130.9403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 166.6503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 297.59



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030219

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

225.00CMT 1.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$297.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$225.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,507.71PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $13.08

CURRENT BALANCE:
$238.08TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,448.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030224

GONZALES V. KELLOGGS FROZENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $35.98

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 26.9803/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 26.98

$26.98NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$35.98PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$9.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030230

GONZALES V. M&M MARSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $832.47

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of file re: settlement offer; Review of 
American Promotional decision re: facts in case.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 
reviewing file.

03/15/2004 PDB 0.30

136.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 
Reviewing file.

03/22/2004 PDB 0.80

204.00Preparing correspondence to opposing counsel; 
Reviewing file; telephone conversation with 
opposing counsel.

03/23/2004 PDB 1.20

34.00Reviewing file; telephone call to client.03/30/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 510.003.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 80.9503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 80.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030230

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce
425.00PDB 2.50 170.00Paul Barber

$80.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$510.00NEW SERVICES:
$832.47PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $29.64

CURRENT BALANCE:
$539.64TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,291.16



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030239

GONZALES V. MEAD JOHNSON FORMULARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,879.76

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 53.9603/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 53.96

$53.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,879.76PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,825.80



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 56

03/31/2004
CWP-2030242

GONZALES V. MINUTE MAIDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,173.61

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Reviewed file, docket and prepared status memo for 
C. Pierce.

03/29/2004 MCG 0.20

Total of New Services: 25.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 265.0603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 90.8703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 355.93

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

25.00MCG 0.20 125.00Marisol Garcia

$355.93NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$25.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,173.61PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.45

CURRENT BALANCE:
$26.45TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$844.13



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030245

GONZALES V. MISSION FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,628.53

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: payment; email opposing 
attorney(s) re: status.

03/04/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: status 
of payment.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
payment, address.

03/16/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with Jim Rasmussen re: status 
conference.

03/19/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
w-9, status conference.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: status 
conference; email opposing attorney(s) re: same, 
payment.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: check; 
email to Yvette Gonzales re: confirmation; email 
opposing attorney(s) re: same.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 319.001.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 134.1203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 47.2203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 181.34



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030245

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
289.00CWP 1.70 170.00Chris Pierce

$181.34NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$319.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,628.53PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $18.54

CURRENT BALANCE:
$337.54TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,784.73



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030248

GONZALES V. MOREY'S SEAFOODRE:
INTERNATIONAL

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $277.24

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: approval of dismissal order; Reviewed and revised 
same and email to court.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal.03/23/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: vacating status 

conference.
03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

0.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 153.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.9303/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 107.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030248

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00CMT 0.20 0.00Cynthia Tessman
153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$107.93NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$153.00NEW SERVICES:
$277.24PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.89

CURRENT BALANCE:
$161.89TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$331.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030272

GONZALES V. REDDY ICE CORP.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,790.52

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

68.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status; Email to opposing attorney(s) re: same.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.40

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: status 
conference; email opposing attorney(s) re: same.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.20

25.00Reviewed file and docket to determine payment  due 
date.  Prepared status memo for C. Pierce.

03/29/2004 MCG 0.20

0.00Review scheduling order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 127.001.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 154.7503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 53.5703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 208.32



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030272

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00CMT 0.20 0.00Cynthia Tessman
102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

25.00MCG 0.20 125.00Marisol Garcia

$208.32NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$127.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,790.52PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $7.38

CURRENT BALANCE:
$134.38TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,716.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030280

GONZALES V. ROYAL/JUAREZ DISTRIB.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,194.14

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
requested extensions; email to opposing attorney(s) 
re: approval.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.30

102.00Review of documents from defendant  re: new value; 
Legal research for new value defense; analyze 
spreadsheets re: claims, defenses.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.60

25.00Reviewed letter from A. Rocha re: documentation.03/04/2004 MCG 0.20
37.50Drafted letter to A. Rocha .03/04/2004 MCG 0.30
37.50Reviewed file and prepared status report for C. 

Pierce.
03/29/2004 MCG 0.30

34.00Telephone conference with Jim Rasmussen re: status.03/31/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 287.001.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 324.5803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 50.3903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 374.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030280

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

187.00CWP 1.10 170.00Chris Pierce
100.00MCG 0.80 125.00Marisol Garcia

$374.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$287.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,194.14PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $16.68

CURRENT BALANCE:
$303.68TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,122.85



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030281

GONZALES V. S.C. JOHNSON & CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $497.32

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 53.9603/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 53.96

$53.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$497.32PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$443.36



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030284

GONZALES V. SANTA FE TORTILLA CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,623.23

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: payment schedule; Email to Yvette 
Gonzales re: payments.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.30

0.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 85.000.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 240.4603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 110.7103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 351.17



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030284

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00CMT 0.20 0.00Cynthia Tessman
85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$351.17NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$85.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,623.23PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.94

CURRENT BALANCE:
$89.94TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,362.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030290

GONZALES V. SEVEN UP/RC BOTTLINGRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,079.95

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

204.00Review of file, summary judgment response, 
documents re: Court's decision in American 
Promotional; analyze spreadsheets, defenses; Legal 
research for defenses, payments within terms during 
preference period.

03/03/2004 CWP 1.20

238.00Reviewed and revised settlement letter;  analyze 
figures, Rachel Kefauver recalculation; Telephone 
conferences with Rachel Kefauver re: same; revise 
letter, calculations.

03/04/2004 CWP 1.40

153.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement, discovery, depositions; Preparation of 
order extending deadlines and email to opposing 
attorney(s).

03/04/2004 CWP 0.90

17.00Email Court's opinion to opposing attorney(s).03/04/2004 CWP 0.10
68.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 

scheduling order, Excel spreadsheet; email order to 
Court.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.40

34.00Review of filed scheduling order.03/10/2004 CWP 0.20
136.00Telephone conference with Colleen Johnson re: 

credits, accounting, documentation, proof, effect of 
Nabisco ruling; Review of file, documents re: 
settlement.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.80

114.00Review of Nabisco decision.03/24/2004 WFD 0.60
57.00Conference with Chris W. Pierce re: appeal.03/24/2004 WFD 0.30
75.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding draft 

settlement letter (.1).  Review draft and attachments 
(.3).  Follow-up conference with Chris Pierce (.1).

03/24/2004 ADG 0.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 69

03/31/2004
CWP-2030290

170.00Review of file, memos, spreadsheets re: settlement; 
Telephone conference with Rachel Kefauver analysis 
of claim, reconciliation, settlement, re-working of 
spreadsheets.

03/24/2004 CWP 1.00

459.00Review of new spreadsheets emailed by Rachel 
Kefauver; Reviewed and revised settlement letter; 
Legal research for same re: cases cited by court in 
opinion, cases on calculation; analyze and calculate 
settlement amounts; prepare exhibits to letter; 
approve of letter for faxing to opposing attorney(s).

03/24/2004 CWP 2.70

51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: post-petition 
claims, proof.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

125.00Prepare Motion to Approve Settlement, Notice of 
Deadline to Object to Motion to Approve Settlement, 
Mutual Release and Settlement Agreement, Order 
Approving Settlement, Order Dismissing Adversary.

03/29/2004 JG 2.50

136.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement; Review of files re: same; coordinate with 
release of prepaids.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.80

30.00Status conference with Chris Pierce.03/30/2004 ADG 0.20
75.00Review file, available documents pertaining to claims 

in connection with settlement discussions.
03/30/2004 ADG 0.50

289.00Telephone conferences with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement; Review of files, boxes; Conferences with 
Anne Goodman, Telephone conferences with Tom 
Walker re: records; Telephone conference with 
Yvette Gonzales re: approval of settlement.

03/30/2004 CWP 1.70

255.00Email to Jonathan Alter re: settlement; Conference 
with Jina Garcia, paralegal re: preparation of motion, 
order, motion; Reviewed and revised same; approve 
for fax to opposing attorney(s); Telephone conference 
with opposing attorney(s) re: changes; Reviewed and 
revised documents and fax to opposing attorney(s).

03/30/2004 CWP 1.50

34.00Review of order denying summary judgment.03/30/2004 CWP 0.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030290

119.00Review of email from Jonathan Alter re: approval of 
settlement; Reviewed and revised Motion, Notice, 
Settlement Agreement and prepare for filing, notice.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.70

Total of New Services: 2,839.0018.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 349.1803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,191.1803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,540.36

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

180.00ADG 1.20 150.00Anne Goodman
2,363.00CWP 13.90 170.00Chris Pierce

125.00JG 2.50 50.00Jina Garcia
171.00WFD 0.90 190.00William Davis

$1,540.36NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,839.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,079.95PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $165.02

CURRENT BALANCE:
$3,004.02TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$4,543.61



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030300

GONZALES V. TOPCORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $13,661.72

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s); review 
ACE Docket; Reviewed and revised order of 
dismissal; email to judge.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal.03/08/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 85.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 885.2503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 67.4603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 952.71



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030300

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$952.71NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$85.00NEW SERVICES:
$13,661.72PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.94

CURRENT BALANCE:
$89.94TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$12,798.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030307

GONZALES V. TREE OF LIFE SOUTHWESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,855.55

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Reviewed letter with offer.03/19/2004 MCG 0.20
25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: settlement.03/19/2004 MCG 0.20
75.00Reviewed federal express records and wire transfer 

records.
03/19/2004 MCG 0.60

37.50Drafted letter re: settlement.03/19/2004 MCG 0.30
34.00Conference with Marisol C. Garcia re: settlement.03/19/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of witness list.03/22/2004 CWP 0.20

125.00Calculated actual payment terms.  Revised settlement 
letter.

03/23/2004 MCG 1.00

51.00Review of settlement offer; Conference with Marisol 
Garcia.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.30

37.50Revised settlement letter.03/25/2004 MCG 0.30
12.50Discussion with C. Pierce re: revising letter.03/25/2004 MCG 0.10

187.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: settlement letter; 
Review of file; Reviewed and revised settlement 
letter; Preparation of exhibits; approve for mailing.

03/29/2004 CWP 1.10

85.00Review of letter accepting settlement; Conference 
with Marisol Garcia re: same; Conference with Jina 
Garcia, paralegal re: preparation of settlement 
documents.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.50

25.00Meeting with W. Davis re: status of trial setting and 
discussed settlement letter.

03/30/2004 MCG 0.20

12.50Reviewed letter re: settlement.03/30/2004 MCG 0.10
62.50Additional revision to settlement letter.03/30/2004 MCG 0.50

0.00Review two e-mails from Tom Walker regarding 
settlement with Gourmet Foods and reply to same. 
confer with Marisol Garcia regarding settlement.

03/31/2004 ADG 0.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030307

51.00Review of emails from Tom Walker re: settlement; 
email re: same.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.30

25.00Reviewed emails from A. Goodman and T. Walker.03/31/2004 MCG 0.20
15.00Telephone conference with Judge's office.03/31/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with MCG.03/31/2004 CMT 0.10

0.00Review e-mails re: settlement.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 934.507.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 188.0803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 83.7203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 271.80



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030307

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00ADG 0.30 0.00Anne Goodman
30.00CMT 0.40 75.00Cynthia Tessman

442.00CWP 2.60 170.00Chris Pierce
462.50MCG 3.70 125.00Marisol Garcia

$271.80NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$934.50NEW SERVICES:
$1,855.55PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $54.32

CURRENT BALANCE:
$988.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,572.57



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030311

GONZALES V. UNILEVER HOME ANDRE:
PERSONAL

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $452.21

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

119.00Review of file re: service, consolidation; analyze 
spreadsheets, amounts sought.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.70

30.00Review status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 

re: status.
03/25/2004 CWP 0.30

85.00Conference with Marisol Garcia, Cynthia M. 
Tessman; Review of draft consolidation order; 
Review of files; Preparation of letter to opposing 
attorney(s); Legal research for relation back.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.50

30.00Meet with CWP re: consolidation and claims.03/29/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Review letter re: claims and review file.03/29/2004 CMT 0.30

119.00Conference with Marisol Garcia, Cynthia Tessman 
re: first amended complaint, motion to consolidate, 
settlement; Reviewed and revised first amended 
complaint, motion to consolidate; Reviewed and 
revised letter to opposing attorney(s); approve for 
mailing.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.70

12.50Meeting with C. Pierce and C. Tessman re: 
preparation of amended complaint and revising order 
consolidating and granting leave to amend.

03/30/2004 MCG 0.10

87.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: Order and Amended 
Complaint.

03/30/2004 MCG 0.70

62.50Revised order to include leave to amend complaint.03/30/2004 MCG 0.50
12.50Reviewed letter to D. Bass.03/30/2004 MCG 0.10
12.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: revision to stipulated 

order.
03/30/2004 MCG 0.10

15.00Meet with CWP and MCG.03/30/2004 CMT 0.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030311

105.00Meet with MCG re: consolidation and revisions to 
complaint.

03/30/2004 CMT 0.70

195.00Revise complaint.03/30/2004 CMT 1.30
15.00Revise letter.03/30/2004 CMT 0.10

105.00Prepare exhibits.03/30/2004 CMT 0.70
30.00Revise Stipulated order.03/30/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Meet with MCG re: stipulated order.03/30/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 1,176.507.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 59.5203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 142.8503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 202.37



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030311

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

615.00CMT 4.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman
374.00CWP 2.20 170.00Chris Pierce
187.50MCG 1.50 125.00Marisol Garcia

$202.37NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,176.50NEW SERVICES:
$452.21PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $68.38

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,244.88TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$1,494.72



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030320

GONZALES V. WISCONSINS FINESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,111.47

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 81.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 40.4703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 40.47



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-2030320

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce

$40.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$81.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,111.47PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.71

CURRENT BALANCE:
$85.71TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,156.71

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

03/31/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

PREPAID ADVERSARY 
ADMINISTRATION

765.821,586.121120043 3,577.242,756.94

A/R ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATION
617.42859.201120044 439.65197.87

AURORA FOODS - FROZEN
47.6272.4903110149 88.3663.49

BEST FOODS
0.006.6103110155 229.87223.26

COCA COLA - DURANGO
150.79264.5403110167 516.90403.15

COCA COLA - SANTA FE
130.95242.0403110179 111.090.00

EASTMAN KODAK
214.27997.3003110200 1,012.64229.61

INTERNATIONAL HOME FOOD
107.14206.3403110218 162.6963.49

JIMMY DEAN
107.14203.6803110219 521.91425.37

KELLOGG
40.4753.9603110221 13.490.00

LIPTON
198.00864.3603110227 849.94183.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

03/31/2004
CWP-1120043

McNEIL CONSUMER HEALTHCARE
130.95419.9403110236 579.97290.98

MEAD JOHNSON
184.91336.7503110239 283.05131.21

MINUTE MAID
147.61317.1703110242 223.5253.96

NATURAL WEATH VITAMINS
130.95376.2903110251 324.7079.36

PEYTON MEATS
171.42325.3703110257 201.5747.62

PLAYTEX (WOOLITE)
220.23396.1303110260 207.6431.74

POMPEIAN INC.
130.95253.9503110263 249.98126.98

QUAKER OATS
130.95259.9103110266 192.4563.49

QUAKER PASTA RONI RICE
83.33307.5203110269 224.190.00

ROSS LABORATORIES
130.95412.0103110278 459.35178.29

S.C. JOHNSON
184.91381.8403110281 276.2979.36

SEVEN UP / RC
534.49843.3303110290 398.7889.94

SHAMROCK FARMS
47.62266.1203110293 218.500.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

03/31/2004
CWP-1120043

TROPICANA
107.14227.5003110308 210.3089.94

UNILEVER
107.14259.9003110311 200.3847.62

WHITEHALL-ROBBINS
130.95462.9303110317 363.7231.74

5,888.99 4,954.12 12,138.1711,203.30Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

03/31/2004
CWP-1120043

PREPAID ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,586.12

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

153.00Review of files, letters, spreadsheets re: defenses, 
proof, documents, exhibits; Reviewed and revised 
discovery, complaints re: interest, further requests for 
relief.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.90

90.00Review files for information on claims.03/11/2004 CMT 0.60
180.00Review boxes re: information for post-petition 

claims.
03/12/2004 CMT 1.20

137.50Review documents03/15/2004 MCG 1.10
555.00Review boxes for information for post-petition 

claims.
03/15/2004 CMT 3.70

90.00continue review of boxes.03/16/2004 CMT 0.60
495.00Continue review of boxes.03/17/2004 CMT 3.30
105.00Draft of memo on status of claims.03/17/2004 CMT 0.70
250.00Reviewed documents.03/19/2004 MCG 2.00
250.00Reviewed documents.03/26/2004 MCG 2.00
150.00Continue review of documents for verification of 

claims.
03/30/2004 CMT 1.00

150.00Reviewed documents.03/31/2004 MCG 1.20

Total of New Services: 2,605.5018.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 407.5103/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 358.3103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 765.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-1120043

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,665.00CMT 11.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman
153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce
787.50MCG 6.30 125.00Marisol Garcia

$765.82NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,605.50NEW SERVICES:
$1,586.12PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $151.44

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,756.94TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$3,577.24



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 6

03/31/2004
CWP-1120044

A/R ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $859.20

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

187.00Review of files, letters, spreadsheets re: defenses, 
proof, documents, exhibits; Reviewed and revised 
discovery, complaints re: interest, further requests for 
relief.

03/08/2004 CWP 1.10

Total of New Services: 187.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 145.2303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 472.1903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 617.42



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 7

03/31/2004
CWP-1120044

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

187.00CWP 1.10 170.00Chris Pierce

$617.42NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$187.00NEW SERVICES:
$859.20PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $10.87

CURRENT BALANCE:
$197.87TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$439.65



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 8

03/31/2004
CWP-03110149

AURORA FOODS - FROZENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $72.49

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

60.00Begin analysis of documents for post-petition claim.03/26/2004 CMT 0.40

Total of New Services: 60.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 47.6203/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 47.62

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

60.00CMT 0.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$47.62NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$60.00NEW SERVICES:
$72.49PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.49

CURRENT BALANCE:
$63.49TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$88.36



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 9

03/31/2004
CWP-03110155

BEST FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $6.61

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

75.00Begin review of documents for post-petition analysis.03/26/2004 CMT 0.50
85.00Conference with Marisol Garcia; Review of draft 

consolidation order; Review of files; Preparation of 
letter to opposing attorney(s); Legal research for 
relation back.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Conference with Marisol Garcia, Cynthia Tessman 
re: first amended complaint, motion to consolidate, 
settlement; Reviewed and revised first amended 
complaint, motion to consolidate; Reviewed and 
revised letter to opposing attorney(s); approve for 
mailing.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 211.001.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 10

03/31/2004
CWP-03110155

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

75.00CMT 0.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman
136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$211.00NEW SERVICES:
$6.61PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $12.26

CURRENT BALANCE:
$223.26TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$229.87



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 11

03/31/2004
CWP-03110167

COCA COLA - DURANGORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $264.54

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of email re: settlement; Conference with 
Cynthia Tessman re: same.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.30

15.00Review e-mail from company re: settlement.03/08/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with ADG re: other claims against company.03/08/2004 CMT 0.10
60.00Review documentation on claim.03/08/2004 CMT 0.40
15.00Meet with CWP re: settlement.03/09/2004 CMT 0.10

195.00Draft Settlement documents.03/25/2004 CMT 1.30
30.00E-mail to defendant re: settlement.03/29/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 381.002.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 43.6503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 150.79



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 12

03/31/2004
CWP-03110167

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

330.00CMT 2.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce

$150.79NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$381.00NEW SERVICES:
$264.54PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $22.15

CURRENT BALANCE:
$403.15TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$516.90



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 13

03/31/2004
CWP-03110179

COCA COLA - SANTA FERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $242.04

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$242.04PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$111.09



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 14

03/31/2004
CWP-03110200

EASTMAN KODAKRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $997.30

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of signed signature page on settlement 
agreement; Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: same.

03/01/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
85.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 

re: approval of dismissal order; Reviewed and revised 
same and email to court.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal.03/23/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: vacating status 

conference.
03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 217.001.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 121.4203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 92.8503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 214.27



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 15

03/31/2004
CWP-03110200

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00ADG 0.20 150.00Anne Goodman
187.00CWP 1.10 170.00Chris Pierce

$214.27NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$217.00NEW SERVICES:
$997.30PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $12.61

CURRENT BALANCE:
$229.61TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,012.64



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 16

03/31/2004
CWP-03110218

INTERNATIONAL HOME FOODRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $206.34

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

60.00Review claim.03/25/2004 CMT 0.40

Total of New Services: 60.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 107.14

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

60.00CMT 0.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$107.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$60.00NEW SERVICES:
$206.34PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.49

CURRENT BALANCE:
$63.49TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$162.69



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 17

03/31/2004
CWP-03110219

JIMMY DEANRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $203.68

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

68.00Review of file re: settlement, exhibits, proof on 
post-petition claim.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.40

45.00Review documentation on claim.03/17/2004 CMT 0.30
195.00Draft settlement documents.03/25/2004 CMT 1.30

30.00Review e-mail re: settlement.03/26/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Meet with CWP.03/26/2004 CMT 0.20
34.00Conference with Cynthia M. Tessman.03/26/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 402.002.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 83.3303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 107.14



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 18

03/31/2004
CWP-03110219

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

300.00CMT 2.00 150.00Cynthia Tessman
102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$107.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$402.00NEW SERVICES:
$203.68PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $23.37

CURRENT BALANCE:
$425.37TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$521.91



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 19

03/31/2004
CWP-03110221

KELLOGGRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $53.96

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 40.4703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 40.47

$40.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$53.96PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$13.49



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 20

03/31/2004
CWP-03110227

LIPTONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $864.36

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

37.50Reviewed docket and file re: consolidation with 
Unilever.

03/28/2004 MCG 0.30

85.00Conference with Marisol Garcia; Review of draft 
consolidation order; Review of files; Preparation of 
letter to opposing attorney(s); Legal research for 
relation back.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Conference with Marisol Garcia, Cynthia Tessman 
re: first amended complaint, motion to consolidate, 
settlement; Reviewed and revised first amended 
complaint, motion to consolidate; Reviewed and 
revised letter to opposing attorney(s); approve for 
mailing.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 173.501.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 40.4703/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 157.5303/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 198.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 21

03/31/2004
CWP-03110227

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce
37.50MCG 0.30 125.00Marisol Garcia

$198.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$173.50NEW SERVICES:
$864.36PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $10.08

CURRENT BALANCE:
$183.58TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$849.94



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 22

03/31/2004
CWP-03110236

McNEIL CONSUMER HEALTHCARERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $419.94

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s); 
Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: release.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review letter re: claims.03/11/2004 CMT 0.20
136.00Review of settlement agreement, release; Telephone 

conference with Tom Walker re: same; Review of 
motion, settlement agreement attached to motion; 
Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: terms of 
release.

03/15/2004 CWP 0.80

30.00Meet with CWP re: release.03/15/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Review J & J settlement and analyze.03/16/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 275.001.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110236

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

105.00CMT 0.70 150.00Cynthia Tessman
170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$275.00NEW SERVICES:
$419.94PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $15.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$290.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$579.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110239

MEAD JOHNSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $336.75

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s), memo 
from Cynthia Tessman.

03/15/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review letter re: release.03/18/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Review information from CWP.03/22/2004 CMT 0.10
45.00Draft letter to Bailey-Rihn.03/24/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 124.000.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 161.1003/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 184.91



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110239

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

90.00CMT 0.60 150.00Cynthia Tessman
34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$184.91NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$124.00NEW SERVICES:
$336.75PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $7.21

CURRENT BALANCE:
$131.21TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$283.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110242

MINUTE MAIDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $317.17

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of file re: settlement, exhibits, proof on 
post-petition claim.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 51.000.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 147.6103/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 147.61

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce

$147.61NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$51.00NEW SERVICES:
$317.17PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $2.96

CURRENT BALANCE:
$53.96TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$223.52



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110251

NATURAL WEATH VITAMINSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $376.29

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

75.00Review documentation on claim.03/25/2004 CMT 0.50

Total of New Services: 75.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

75.00CMT 0.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$75.00NEW SERVICES:
$376.29PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.36

CURRENT BALANCE:
$79.36TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$324.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110257

PEYTON MEATSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $325.37

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

45.00Begin review of document for post-petition claims.03/29/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 45.000.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 147.6103/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 171.42

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

45.00CMT 0.30 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$171.42NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$45.00NEW SERVICES:
$325.37PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $2.62

CURRENT BALANCE:
$47.62TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$201.57



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110260

PLAYTEX (WOOLITE)RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $396.13

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review letter from opposing counsel re: claim.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 30.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 113.0903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 220.23

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$220.23NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$30.00NEW SERVICES:
$396.13PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.74

CURRENT BALANCE:
$31.74TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$207.64



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110263

POMPEIAN INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $253.95

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Telephone conference with opposing counsel re; 
extension.

03/11/2004 CMT 0.20

15.00Review letter from opposing counsel.03/15/2004 CMT 0.10
75.00Review documentation on claim.03/25/2004 CMT 0.50

Total of New Services: 120.000.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 31

03/31/2004
CWP-03110263

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

120.00CMT 0.80 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$120.00NEW SERVICES:
$253.95PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $6.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$126.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$249.98



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110266

QUAKER OATSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $259.91

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

60.00Review documentation on claim.03/25/2004 CMT 0.40

Total of New Services: 60.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

60.00CMT 0.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$60.00NEW SERVICES:
$259.91PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.49

CURRENT BALANCE:
$63.49TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$192.45



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110269

QUAKER PASTA RONI RICERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $307.52

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 83.3303/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 83.33

$83.33NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$307.52PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$224.19



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110278

ROSS LABORATORIESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $412.01

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: allegations, 
complaint, settlement.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.20

37.50Telephone conference with Aaron Siegman re: 
demand letter and extension.

03/02/2004 MCG 0.30

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: deadlines.03/02/2004 MCG 0.20
17.00Conference with Marisol C. Garcia re: deadlines.03/02/2004 CWP 0.10
25.00Revised letter to A. Siegman.03/04/2004 MCG 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with opposing counsel.03/19/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 168.501.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 35

03/31/2004
CWP-03110278

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce
87.50MCG 0.70 125.00Marisol Garcia

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$168.50NEW SERVICES:
$412.01PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $9.79

CURRENT BALANCE:
$178.29TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$459.35



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110281

S.C. JOHNSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $381.84

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review letter from opposing counsel re: claim.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Review of documents re: claim.03/18/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 75.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 161.1003/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 184.91

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

75.00CMT 0.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$184.91NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$75.00NEW SERVICES:
$381.84PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.36

CURRENT BALANCE:
$79.36TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$276.29



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 37

03/31/2004
CWP-03110290

SEVEN UP / RCRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $843.33

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of files re: A/R claim; Telephone conference 
with Rachel Kefauver; Conference with Anne 
Goodman; Telephone conference with Tom Walker.

03/29/2004 CWP 0.50

Total of New Services: 85.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 318.6303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 215.8603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 534.49



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110290

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$534.49NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$85.00NEW SERVICES:
$843.33PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.94

CURRENT BALANCE:
$89.94TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$398.78



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110293

SHAMROCK FARMSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $266.12

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 47.6203/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 47.62

$47.62NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$266.12PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$218.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110308

TROPICANARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $227.50

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review documentation on claim.03/25/2004 CWP 0.50

Total of New Services: 85.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 107.14

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$107.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$85.00NEW SERVICES:
$227.50PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.94

CURRENT BALANCE:
$89.94TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$210.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-03110311

UNILEVERRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $259.90

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

45.00Analyze post-petition claims re: for consolidation.03/30/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 45.000.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 107.14

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

45.00CMT 0.30 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$107.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$45.00NEW SERVICES:
$259.90PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $2.62

CURRENT BALANCE:
$47.62TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$200.38



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 42

03/31/2004
CWP-03110317

WHITEHALL-ROBBINSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $462.93

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review letter from opposing counsel re: claim.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 30.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 107.1403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 23.8103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 130.95

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$130.95NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$30.00NEW SERVICES:
$462.93PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.74

CURRENT BALANCE:
$31.74TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$363.72

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

03/31/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

GONZALES V. ADVO, INC.
1,889.543,209.053010237 1,693.03373.52

GONZALES V. BRINKS INCORPORATED
276.971,491.183010243 1,583.50369.29

GONZALES V. CHARLES L. HENRY
2,606.164,966.053010245 6,754.284,394.39

GONZALES V. COREMARK
40.47131.473010246 91.000.00

GONZALES V. CUSTOMCRAFT 
FIXTURES

515.841,262.083010249 1,116.58370.34

GONZALES V. CIT GROUP
134.91753.133010250 618.220.00

GONZALES V. EDISON SOURCE
53.96441.773010253 549.70161.89

GONZALES V. EL PASO TIMES
322.201,001.793010257 1,055.22375.63

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL BUSINESS
3.97947.283010263 943.310.00

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL CORP.
1,008.662,206.723010264 1,198.060.00

GONZALES V. HEWLETT PACKARD
226.97692.023010267 858.67393.62



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

03/31/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. HUBERT CO.
536.471,073.473010269 572.9835.98

GONZALES V. HW SINGLETON CO. INC.
738.831,298.323010271 915.02355.53

GONZALES V. IMPACT EVENTS
449.971,096.243010273 1,306.54660.27

GONZALES V. JAN FRIEDERICH
3,688.556,397.073010275 4,053.401,344.88

GONZALES V. JLS SECURITY PATROL
1,807.813,004.563010277 1,196.750.00

GONZALES V. NETCOM MANAGEMENT 
GROUP

53.96370.613010283 352.6335.98

GONZALES V. NM STATE FAIR
26.983,389.183010285 3,362.200.00

GONZALES V. NETWORK ARCHITECHS
540.653,071.953010290 2,567.2835.98

GONZALES V. PDX, INC.
26.98712.913010291 685.930.00

GONZALES V. PRODUCTIVE DATA
334.901,194.913010297 1,811.26951.25

GONZALES V. QUALEX
447.593,262.743010298 2,969.64154.49

GONZALES V. QWEST
230.14859.453010299 1,055.73426.42



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

03/31/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. RICHARDSON & 
RICHARDSON

2,334.754,822.013010301 3,241.50754.24

GONZALES V. RUBBAIR DOOR
372.991,865.203010302 1,492.210.00

GONZALES V. SANTA FE NEW 
MEXICAN

204.351,780.553010303 1,782.01205.81

GONZALES V. SITRICK & CO.
2,449.034,116.363010304 7,511.755,844.42

GONZALES V. SAS INSTITUTE
328.55967.763010305 670.9531.74

GONZALES V. SPECS REFRIGERATION
2,504.584,383.053010306 1,932.4353.96

GONZALES V. TOM DAHLEN
1,077.702,724.943010308 2,028.17380.93

GONZALES V. TOTAL CONTROL
515.841,295.553010309 995.04215.33

GONZALES V. TOTE CART COMPANY
249.18788.043010311 654.20115.34

GONZALES V. WINDWARD
3,245.005,498.553010318 2,454.59201.04

18,242.27 29,244.45 60,073.7871,075.96Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

03/31/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. ADVO, INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,209.05

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of signed IRS form; Letter to opposing 
attorney(s).

03/04/2004 CWP 0.20

68.00Review of file re: settlement, terms, agreement; 
Review of court docket.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.40

68.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: W-9, 
order; Reviewed and revised settlement order; email 
to Court.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.40

68.00Email opposing attorney(s) re: w-9, settlement; 
Review of email re: same; Review of notice of status 
conference.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.40

51.00Email settlement agreement to Yvette.03/22/2004 CWP 0.30
34.00Review of email from Yvette Gonzales re: settlement 

agreement.
03/25/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 353.002.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,714.1603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 175.3803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,889.54



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 5

03/31/2004
CWP-3010237

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
323.00CWP 1.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,889.54NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$353.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,209.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $20.52

CURRENT BALANCE:
$373.52TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,693.03



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 6

03/31/2004
CWP-3010243

GONZALES V. BRINKS INCORPORATEDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,491.18

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Meet with PDB re: settlement.03/08/2004 CMT 0.10
45.00Review e-mail re: changes to settlement.03/08/2004 CMT 0.30
30.00Meet with CWP re: settlement agreement changes.03/09/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with opposing counsel re: 

changes.
03/09/2004 CMT 0.20

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
address change; Review of file re: same.

03/15/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Telephone conference with opposing counsel.03/15/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Review e-mail from opposing counsel.03/15/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Review revisions to settlement agreement.03/17/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with opposing counsel.03/17/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Final settlement documents.03/18/2004 CMT 0.30
30.00Review e-mail re: release.03/26/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 349.002.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 47.6203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 229.3503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 276.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 7

03/31/2004
CWP-3010243

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

315.00CMT 2.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman
34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$276.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$349.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,491.18PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $20.29

CURRENT BALANCE:
$369.29TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,583.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010245

GONZALES V. CHARLES L. HENRYRE:
ARCHITECTS

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,966.05

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

120.00Review Trustee's deposition in Food Marketing case 
(.5).  Draft letter to opposing counsel Skipworth 
regarding depositions (.3).

03/02/2004 ADG 0.80

30.00Telephone conference with Rachel Kefauver 
regarding her scheduled deposition (.1).  Telephone 
conference with Yvette Gonzales regarding her 
scheduled deposition (.1).

03/02/2004 ADG 0.20

68.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: response to 
opposing attorney(s)' deposition requests; Reviewed 
and revised letter, documents.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.40

34.00Telephone conference with Robert Skipworth re: 
documents to be produced, preference screen, 
depositions.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.20

15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding information 
request from opposing counsel.

03/03/2004 ADG 0.10

45.00Two telephone calls with Sage Accounting regarding 
disk to produce to defendant.

03/03/2004 ADG 0.30

34.00Review of notices of deposition.03/03/2004 CWP 0.20
170.00Review of documents from opposing counsel on 

services, dates, defenses;  Legal research for new 
value defense, experts, ordinary course; analyze 
spreadsheets re: claims, defenses.

03/03/2004 CWP 1.00

187.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: additional 
discovery, discs, disclosure, documents; Reviewed 
and revised responses; Reviewed and revised letter to 
opposing attorney(s); approve for filing, mailing.

03/04/2004 CWP 1.10

240.00Review Rachel Kefauver depositions in two other 
cases (1.2). and Ken Fine's deposition in Earthgrains 
case (.4) for possible production to defendant.

03/04/2004 ADG 1.60



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010245

60.00Review defendant's discovery responses served on 
2/23.

03/04/2004 ADG 0.40

45.00Review Gonzales deposition regarding "preference 
screen" (.2).  Conference with Chris Pierce regarding 
enclosures for Skipworth letter (.1).

03/04/2004 ADG 0.30

30.00Telephone conference with Tom Walker regarding 
experts.

03/04/2004 ADG 0.20

45.00Draft letter to opposing counsel Skipworth.03/04/2004 ADG 0.30
195.00Review prior discovery responses (.4).  Prepare 

supplemental responses to defendant's requests for 
production (.9).

03/04/2004 ADG 1.30

30.00Review disk received from Rachel Kefauver.03/04/2004 ADG 0.20
34.00Telephone conference with Jina Garcia, paralegal re: 

documents for production to opposing attorney(s).
03/05/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status, deadlines.03/11/2004 ADG 0.20
15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding deposition 

preparation.
03/15/2004 ADG 0.10

153.00Telephone conference with Rachel Kefauver re: 
deposition; Review of files re: experts; Preparation of 
amendment to witness list and fax to opposing 
attorney(s); Left message with opposing attorney(s).

03/16/2004 CWP 0.90

51.00Review of AP 265 spreadsheet from Rachel; email 
opposing attorney(s) re: spreadsheets.

03/16/2004 CWP 0.30

435.00Review and analyze defendant's documents to assist 
Chris Pierce with deposition preparation.

03/16/2004 ADG 2.90

374.00Review of file, exhibits, discovery responses in 
preparation for deposition; Telephone conference 
with opposing attorney(s) re: same; Conference with 
Anne Goodman re: same.

03/17/2004 CWP 2.20

135.00Prepare new value analysis.03/17/2004 ADG 0.90
420.00Analyze invoice payment information for deposition.03/17/2004 ADG 2.80
120.00Draft memo to Chris Pierce regarding payment 

patterns.
03/17/2004 ADG 0.80



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010245

120.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding Charles 
Henry deposition.

03/17/2004 ADG 0.80

204.00Review of documents in preparation for deposition; 
Preparation of exhibits (FedEx receipts).

03/18/2004 CWP 1.20

340.00Taking deposition of Charles Henry.03/18/2004 CWP 2.00
85.00Conference with Rachel Kefauver re: deposition.03/18/2004 CWP 0.50

204.00Attendance at deposition of Rachel Kefauver.03/18/2004 CWP 1.20
51.00Conference with Anne Goodman, Cynthia Tessman, 

William F. Davis re: results of deposition.
03/18/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: pro 
hac vice application.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 4,153.0026.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,627.6603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 978.5003/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,606.16



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 11

03/31/2004
CWP-3010245

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

2,130.00ADG 14.20 150.00Anne Goodman
2,023.00CWP 11.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,606.16NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$4,153.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,966.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $241.39

CURRENT BALANCE:
$4,394.39TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$6,754.28



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010246

GONZALES V. COREMARKRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $131.47

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 40.4703/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 40.47

$40.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$131.47PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$91.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010249

GONZALES V. CUSTOMCRAFT FIXTURESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,262.08

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review scheduling order.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20
34.00Review of amended witness list.03/09/2004 CWP 0.20

102.00Review of file re: settlement offer, expert issues, 
proof; Legal research for ordinary course; Review of 
American Promotional decision re: facts in case.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.60

150.00Analyze; determine additional discovery needed; 
status; etc.

03/19/2004 CMT 1.00

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement, status.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 350.002.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 427.7503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 88.0903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 515.84



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010249

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

180.00CMT 1.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$515.84NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$350.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,262.08PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $20.34

CURRENT BALANCE:
$370.34TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,116.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010250

GONZALES V. CIT GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $753.13

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 53.9603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 80.9503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 134.91

$134.91NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$753.13PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$618.22



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010253

GONZALES V. EDISON SOURCERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $441.77

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: approval of dismissal order; Reviewed and revised 
same and email to court.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal.03/23/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: vacating status 

conference.
03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

0.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 153.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 53.9603/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 53.96



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010253

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

0.00CMT 0.20 0.00Cynthia Tessman
153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$53.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$153.00NEW SERVICES:
$441.77PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.89

CURRENT BALANCE:
$161.89TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$549.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010257

GONZALES V. EL PASO TIMESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,001.79

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Determine status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
51.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: status, timing; 

Review of emails re: settlement, dismissal.
03/19/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
extensions.

03/19/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review file re: documents sent to Rachel.03/19/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00E-mail Rachel re: analysis.03/19/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review letter from Morrissey.03/19/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Review e-mail from Rachel.03/19/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Respond to Rachel's e-mail.03/19/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review letter from Morrissey.03/22/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Review e-mail from Rachel.03/24/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Review notes from CWP.03/24/2004 CMT 0.10
75.00Draft Stip. Dismissal.03/24/2004 CMT 0.50

Total of New Services: 355.002.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 190.4603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 131.7403/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 322.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010257

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

270.00CMT 1.80 150.00Cynthia Tessman
85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$322.20NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$355.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,001.79PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $20.63

CURRENT BALANCE:
$375.63TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,055.22



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
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PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010263

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL BUSINESSRE:
ASSET

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $947.28

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 3.9703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 3.97

$3.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$947.28PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$943.31
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BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010264

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL CORP.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,206.72

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,008.6603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,008.66

$1,008.66NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$2,206.72PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,198.06



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010267

GONZALES V. HEWLETT PACKARDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $692.02

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Reviewed and revised settlement agreement, motion.03/15/2004 CWP 0.30
195.00Prepare Settlement documents.03/18/2004 CMT 1.30

45.00Review settlement agreement and motion to approve; 
send to opposing counsel.

03/24/2004 CMT 0.30

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 372.002.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 120.6303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 106.3403/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 226.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010267

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

270.00CMT 1.80 150.00Cynthia Tessman
102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$226.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$372.00NEW SERVICES:
$692.02PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $21.62

CURRENT BALANCE:
$393.62TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$858.67



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
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P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010269

GONZALES V. HUBERT CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,073.47

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Reviewing file.03/30/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 485.6803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 50.7903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 536.47

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00PDB 0.20 170.00Paul Barber

$536.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,073.47PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$572.98



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law
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ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010271

GONZALES V. HW SINGLETON CO. INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,298.32

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of file re: status of settlement; fax letter to 
opposing attorney(s).

03/09/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement, status, order, documents.

03/23/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

68.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
revisions to settlement agreement, order; Reviewed 
and revised same and email to court.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.40

34.00Review of email from judge re: order.03/26/2004 CWP 0.20
51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 

judge's email, status; email judge's email to opposing 
attorney(s).

03/29/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 336.002.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 563.4503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 175.3803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 738.83



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010271

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
306.00CWP 1.80 170.00Chris Pierce

$738.83NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$336.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,298.32PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $19.53

CURRENT BALANCE:
$355.53TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$915.02



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010273

GONZALES V. IMPACT EVENTSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,096.24

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review scheduling order.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20
119.00Review of file re: settlement offer, expert issues, 

proof; Legal research for ordinary course; Review of 
American Promotional decision re: facts in case.

03/09/2004 CWP 0.70

30.00Determine status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
285.00Analyze documents produced; determine additional 

discovery needed; refigure preference calculation 
with new information; draft memo to CWP.

03/19/2004 CMT 1.90

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
claim, new value.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Review of file, memo; Conference with Cynthia 
Tessman re: settlement, factor issue.

03/30/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Meet with CWP.03/30/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Begin draft letter to opposing counsel re: revisions 

and recent opinion.
03/31/2004 CMT 0.30

Total of New Services: 624.004.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 47.6203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 402.3503/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 449.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010273

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

420.00CMT 2.80 150.00Cynthia Tessman
204.00CWP 1.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$449.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$624.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,096.24PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $36.27

CURRENT BALANCE:
$660.27TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,306.54



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010275

GONZALES V. JAN FRIEDERICHRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $6,397.07

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

527.00Telephone conversation with courtroom deputy; 
preparing pretrial order; preparing requested findings.

03/04/2004 PDB 3.10

15.00Prepared Plaintiff's Proposed Findings of Fact and 
Law

03/05/2004 KW 0.30

34.00Telephone conference with Chris Wilson re: 
scheduling conference; Conference with Paul Barber 
re: same.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Reviewing file.03/08/2004 PDB 0.20
102.00Appearing telephonically at status conference; 

reviewing file.
03/15/2004 PDB 0.60

272.00Preparing exhibits.03/23/2004 PDB 1.60
15.00Prepared Plaintiff's Exhibit List03/24/2004 KW 0.30

238.00Preparing exhibits for court.03/24/2004 PDB 1.40
34.00Reviewing file.03/30/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 1,271.007.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 2,030.7303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,657.8203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,688.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010275

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce
30.00KW 0.60 50.00Kimberlee White

1,207.00PDB 7.10 170.00Paul Barber

$3,688.55NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,271.00NEW SERVICES:
$6,397.07PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $73.88

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,344.88TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$4,053.40



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010277

GONZALES V. JLS SECURITY PATROLRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,004.56

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,558.6203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 249.1903/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,807.81

$1,807.81NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$3,004.56PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,196.75



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010283

GONZALES V. NETCOM MANAGEMENT GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $370.61

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter re: payment.03/10/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on February 2004 statement. 53.9603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 53.96

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$53.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$370.61PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$352.63



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010285

GONZALES V. NM STATE FAIRRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,389.18

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 26.9803/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 26.98

$26.98NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$3,389.18PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$3,362.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010290

GONZALES V. NETWORK ARCHITECHSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,071.95

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Reviewing correspondence.03/15/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 147.6103/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 183.3203/23/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement (Expenses). 209.7203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 540.65

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00PDB 0.20 170.00Paul Barber

$540.65NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,071.95PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,567.28



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010291

GONZALES V. PDX, INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $712.91

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 26.9803/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 26.98

$26.98NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$712.91PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$685.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010297

GONZALES V. PRODUCTIVE DATARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,194.91

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

45.00Review file, draft memo to Chris Pierce.03/04/2004 ADG 0.30
30.00Conference with Chris Pierce (.1).  Telephone 

conference with Tom Walker regarding settlement 
formats (.1).

03/04/2004 ADG 0.20

45.00Telephone conference with David Thuma regarding 
settlement affidavit in similar case (.2).  Review 
Thuma e-mail and attached affidavit (.1).

03/04/2004 ADG 0.30

51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: discovery 
deadline, possible settlement terms, affidavit; Review 
of pleadings in similar case.

03/04/2004 CWP 0.30

153.00Review of file, documents re: Court's decision in 
American Promotional; analyze spreadsheets, 
defenses; Legal research for defenses, payments 
within terms during preference period.

03/08/2004 CWP 0.90

68.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: status; Review 
of documents in other preference case re: settlement, 
format, financials.

03/11/2004 CWP 0.40

119.00Telephone conferences with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement.

03/19/2004 CWP 0.70

15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding exhibits and 
possible settlement.

03/22/2004 ADG 0.10

68.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement; email to Yvette Gonzales re: 
recommendation.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.40

119.00Review of email from Yvette Gonzales approving 
settlement; Review of opposing attorney(s)' witness 
list, exhibits; Telephone conference with opposing 
attorney(s) re: settlement.

03/22/2004 CWP 0.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010297

50.00Prepare Motion to Approve Settlement, Stipulated 
Judgment, Notice of Deadline to File Objections, 
Settlement Agreement and Mutual Release, and 
Order Approving Settlement.

03/25/2004 JG 1.00

136.00Conference with Jina Garcia,  paralegal re: 
preparation of settlement motion, agreement, notice; 
Reviewed and revised same and prepare for filing; 
Review of file re: terms, status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.80

Total of New Services: 899.006.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 191.2603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 143.6403/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 334.90



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010297

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

135.00ADG 0.90 150.00Anne Goodman
714.00CWP 4.20 170.00Chris Pierce

50.00JG 1.00 50.00Jina Garcia

$334.90NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$899.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,194.91PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $52.25

CURRENT BALANCE:
$951.25TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,811.26



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010298

GONZALES V. QUALEXRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,262.74

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

136.00Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel; 
Preparing pleadings.

03/01/2004 PDB 0.80

10.00Prepared letter to Yvette Gonzales enclosing 
settlement check and copy of dismissal order

03/10/2004 KW 0.20

Total of New Services: 146.001.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 264.2703/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 183.3203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 447.59



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010298

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

10.00KW 0.20 50.00Kimberlee White
136.00PDB 0.80 170.00Paul Barber

$447.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$146.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,262.74PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.49

CURRENT BALANCE:
$154.49TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,969.64



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010299

GONZALES V. QWESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $859.45

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of email from Tom Walker re: settlement.03/02/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of email from Tom Walker re: settlement; 

Telephone conference with Vic Carlin, Tom Walker 
re: same.

03/02/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of emails from Tom Walker, Vic Carlin; 
Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: same.

03/10/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status.03/12/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Draft memo to CWP.03/19/2004 CMT 0.20
75.00Draft dismissal.03/19/2004 CMT 0.50
34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status; 

emails to opposing attorney(s) re: dismissal.
03/22/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/25/2004 CWP 0.20

68.00Review of emails from attorneys re: settlement; 
Preparation of order of dismissal and email to Carlin; 
Review of email approving same.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.40

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 403.002.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 203.1603/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 26.9803/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 230.14



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010299

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

165.00CMT 1.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman
238.00CWP 1.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$230.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$403.00NEW SERVICES:
$859.45PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $23.42

CURRENT BALANCE:
$426.42TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,055.73



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010301

GONZALES V. RICHARDSON & RICHARDSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,822.01

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

187.00Review of file re: settlement offer, expert issues, 
proof; Legal research for ordinary course; Review of 
American Promotional decision re: facts in case; 
Review of case law re: secured claim, lessee's 
interest, unsecured nature of claim.

03/09/2004 CWP 1.10

34.00Review of notice of completion of briefing.03/22/2004 CWP 0.20
51.00Legal research for new value, secured claims, liens.03/26/2004 CWP 0.30
34.00Review of letter re: scheduling; fax response.03/26/2004 CWP 0.20

136.00Conference with William F. Davis re: filing of lien, 
automatic stay, third parties; Legal research for same.

03/31/2004 CWP 0.80

Total of New Services: 442.002.60

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
151.99Westlaw Legal Research charge  - dated 02/16/04.03/24/2004
134.56Westlaw Legal Research charge  - dated 02/17/04.03/24/2004

Total of New Expenses: 286.55

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 369.4203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,965.3303/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,334.75



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010301

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

442.00CWP 2.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,334.75NEW PAYMENTS:
$286.55NEW EXPENSES:
$442.00NEW SERVICES:

$4,822.01PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $25.69

CURRENT BALANCE:
$754.24TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$3,241.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010302

GONZALES V. RUBBAIR DOORRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,865.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 372.9903/02/2004

Total of New Payments: 372.99

$372.99NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,865.20PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,492.21



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 46

03/31/2004
CWP-3010303

GONZALES V. SANTA FE NEW MEXICANRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,780.55

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/26/2004 CWP 0.20

62.50Reviewed file and docket re: order dismissing.03/28/2004 MCG 0.50
34.00Conference with Marisol Garcia; email dismissal 

order to Court.
03/29/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of order dismissing case.03/30/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 194.501.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 174.5903/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 29.7603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 204.35



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010303

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

62.50MCG 0.50 125.00Marisol Garcia

$204.35NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$194.50NEW SERVICES:
$1,780.55PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $11.31

CURRENT BALANCE:
$205.81TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,782.01



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010304

GONZALES V. SITRICK & CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,116.36

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

289.00Reviewing file; preparing for deposition.; Reviewing 
correspondence from  opposing counsel.

03/03/2004 PDB 1.70

238.00Reviewing file; preparing for depositions.03/08/2004 PDB 1.40
391.00Preparing for depositions in Los Angeles.03/09/2004 PDB 2.30

15.00Prepared documents for depositions on March 11, 
2004

03/10/2004 KW 0.30

731.00Preparing for deposition; telephone conversation with 
opposing counsel.

03/10/2004 PDB 4.30

918.00Traveling to Los Angeles for depositions.03/10/2004 PDB 5.40
1,292.00Conferring with  opposing counsel; telephone 

conversation with client; preparing for and appearing 
at deposition; telephone conversation with opposing 
counsel; preparing for deposition of Carney;

03/11/2004 PDB 7.60

612.00Traveling from Los Angeles.03/11/2004 PDB 3.60
51.00Conference with Paul Barber re: claims, defenses, 

discovery, settlement.
03/12/2004 CWP 0.30

272.00Reviewing file and deposition notes; conferring with 
legal assistant.

03/12/2004 PDB 1.60

10.00Prepare Certificate of Service for Plaintiff's 
Objections and Responses to Interrogatories and 
Request for Production

03/18/2004 KW 0.20

15.00Prepared Notice of Cancellation of Deposition of 
Jack Leone.  Informed Court Reporter of 
cancellation.

03/18/2004 KW 0.30

68.00Reviewing memorandum; reviewing pleadings from 
opposing counsel.

03/18/2004 PDB 0.40

136.00Reviewing pleadings; preparing correspondence.03/19/2004 PDB 0.80



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010304

Total of New Services: 5,038.0030.20

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
513.59Travel exp to Los Angeles for Michael Sitrick 

deposition.
03/12/2004

Total of New Expenses: 513.59

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,371.3303/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,077.7003/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,449.03

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

51.00CWP 0.30 170.00Chris Pierce
40.00KW 0.80 50.00Kimberlee White

4,947.00PDB 29.10 170.00Paul Barber

$2,449.03NEW PAYMENTS:
$513.59NEW EXPENSES:

$5,038.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,116.36PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $292.83

CURRENT BALANCE:
$5,844.42TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$7,511.75



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010305

GONZALES V. SAS INSTITUTERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $967.76

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review scheduling order.03/08/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 30.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 151.1803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 177.3703/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 328.55

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$328.55NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$30.00NEW SERVICES:
$967.76PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.74

CURRENT BALANCE:
$31.74TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$670.95



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010306

GONZALES V. SPECS REFRIGERATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,383.05

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Telephone conversation with legal assistant of 
opposing counsel.

03/04/2004 PDB 0.30

Total of New Services: 51.000.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 1,318.9503/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 1,185.6303/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,504.58

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

51.00PDB 0.30 170.00Paul Barber

$2,504.58NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$51.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,383.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $2.96

CURRENT BALANCE:
$53.96TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,932.43



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010308

GONZALES V. TOM DAHLENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,724.94

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Conferring with opposing counsel.03/02/2004 PDB 0.30
102.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 

Preparing correspondence to opposing counsel.
03/04/2004 PDB 0.60

51.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel and 
conference call with courtroom deputy.

03/15/2004 PDB 0.30

10.00Prepare Stipulated Order Extending Deadline for 
Pretrial Order

03/17/2004 KW 0.20

51.00Preparing pleadings.03/18/2004 PDB 0.30
51.00Reviewing pleadings.03/19/2004 PDB 0.30
10.00Edited letter to Yvette Gonzales03/22/2004 KW 0.20
34.00Reviewing file.03/30/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 360.002.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 349.1803/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 728.5203/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,077.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010308

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

20.00KW 0.40 50.00Kimberlee White
340.00PDB 2.00 170.00Paul Barber

$1,077.70NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$360.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,724.94PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $20.93

CURRENT BALANCE:
$380.93TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,028.17



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010309

GONZALES V. TOTAL CONTROLRE:
INFORMATION

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,295.55

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of file re: exhibits, settlement status; compare 
facts to American Promotional decisions; analyze 
spreadsheets re: same.

03/11/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Review of notice of status conference; Review of file 
re: status.

03/24/2004 CWP 0.30

37.50Reviewed file, docket and prepared status memo for 
C. Pierce.

03/29/2004 MCG 0.30

30.00Review Scheduling Order.03/31/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 203.501.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 69.4403/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 446.4003/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 515.84



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 55

03/31/2004
CWP-3010309

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce

37.50MCG 0.30 125.00Marisol Garcia

$515.84NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$203.50NEW SERVICES:
$1,295.55PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $11.83

CURRENT BALANCE:
$215.33TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$995.04



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010311

GONZALES V. TOTE CART COMPANYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $788.04

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Prepared Stipulated Order Resulting From Final 
Pretrial Conference

03/29/2004 RB 0.50

50.00Reviewed file and docket and prepared status memo 
for C. Pierce.

03/29/2004 MCG 0.40

34.00Telephone conference with Jill Peterson re: trial date.03/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 109.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 195.2203/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 53.9603/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 249.18



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010311

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce
50.00MCG 0.40 125.00Marisol Garcia
25.00RB 0.50 50.00Renee Baca

$249.18NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$109.00NEW SERVICES:
$788.04PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $6.34

CURRENT BALANCE:
$115.34TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$654.20



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010318

GONZALES V. WINDWARDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $5,498.55

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel.03/02/2004 PDB 0.20
10.00Prepare Stipulated Order Extending Deadline for 

Pretrial Order
03/17/2004 KW 0.20

51.00Preparing pleadings.03/18/2004 PDB 0.30
51.00Reviewing pleadings.03/19/2004 PDB 0.30
10.00Edited letter to Yvette Gonzales03/22/2004 KW 0.20
34.00Reviewing file.03/30/2004 PDB 0.20

Total of New Services: 190.001.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on January 2004 statement. 830.8903/02/2004
Payment on February 2004 statement. 2,414.1103/23/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,245.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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03/31/2004
CWP-3010318

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

20.00KW 0.40 50.00Kimberlee White
170.00PDB 1.00 170.00Paul Barber

$3,245.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$190.00NEW SERVICES:
$5,498.55PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $11.04

CURRENT BALANCE:
$201.04TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,454.59

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

04/30/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

FEE & EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS
3,686.5211,530.411120036 8,243.10399.21

CASE ADMINISTRATION
111.94147.921120135 35.980.00

LIQUOR LICENSE
314.59314.5903040035 0.000.00

399.21 4,113.05 8,279.0811,992.92Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

04/30/2004
CWP-1120036

FEE & EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONSRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $11,530.41

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Prepare Letter to R. Andazola re: extension to file 
objection to D&P Fee App. [L143]

04/01/2004 JG 0.50

50.00Draft Order Approving Second Fee Application. 
[L143]

04/14/2004 JG 1.00

34.00Telephone conference with Ronald Andazola re: 
status of withdrawal, objection. [L197]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

119.00Reviewed and revised order allowing 2nd fee app. 
and email to Court. [L193]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.70

34.00Review of signed order allowing 2d fee app.; fax to 
Yvette Gonzales. [L193]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.20

64.00Conference with Chris W. Pierce re: breakdown of 
fee application amounts; calculate same. [L193]

04/21/2004 DK 0.80

51.00Review of email from Yvette Gonzales re: 
accounting, breakdown; Telephone conference with 
Yvette Gonzales re: same; Conference with Diane 
Kazimiroff re: same; email to Yvette re: breakdown. 
[L193]

04/21/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 377.003.70

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
0.30Long Distance Phone charge [E105]04/01/2004

Total of New Expenses: 0.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 3,686.5204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,686.52



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

04/30/2004
CWP-1120036

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

238.00CWP 1.40 170.00Chris Pierce
64.00DK 0.80 80.00Diane Kazimiroff
75.00JG 1.50 50.00Jina Garcia

$3,686.52NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.30NEW EXPENSES:

$377.00NEW SERVICES:
$11,530.41PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $21.91

CURRENT BALANCE:
$399.21TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$8,243.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

04/30/2004
CWP-1120135

CASE ADMINISTRATIONRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $147.92

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order 
(expenses).

22.0004/28/2004

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 89.9404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 111.94

$111.94NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$147.92PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$35.98



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 5

04/30/2004
CWP-03040035

LIQUOR LICENSERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $314.59

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order 
(expenses).

4.0004/28/2004

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 310.5904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 314.59

$314.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$314.59PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$0.00

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

04/30/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

PREFERENCE ACTIONS 
ADMINISTRATION

14,456.4218,050.531120038 6,354.982,760.87

GONZALES V. ALLIED SUPPLY CO.
1,290.411,502.572030138 324.59112.43

GONZALES V. AMERICAN 
PROMOTIONAL

5,758.326,323.902030143 1,312.60747.02

GONZALES V. ANDERSON NEWS
1,974.203,431.512030146 1,457.310.00

GONZALES V. AZAR NUT COMPANY
2,390.302,606.962030152 960.52743.86

GONZALES V. BUNZL USA
3,425.194,692.022030158 2,735.511,468.68

GONZALES V. C&H SUGAR
589.63798.352030159 280.6771.95

GONZALES V. CAMPBELL SALES CO.
526.43602.882030163 76.450.00

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - DEMING
1,004.701,052.052030164 258.98211.63

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - 
ENTERPRISES

6,113.077,258.482030169 6,286.845,141.43



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - PHOENIX
0.000.002030176 111.10111.10

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - SANTA FE
765.54840.132030179 258.70184.11

GONZALES V. DEAN FOODS, INC.
3,407.165,460.182030188 3,473.021,420.00

GONZALES V. DPI FOOD PRODUCTS
1,746.442,042.052030197 295.610.00

GONZALES V. FLOWERS - EL PASO
732.75741.752030204 9.000.00

GONZALES V. FOOD MARKETING 
GROUP

4,222.704,411.572030206 674.55485.68

GONZALES V. GERBER PRODUCTS CO.
261.36366.122030208 410.56305.80

GONZALES V. HOLIDAY CANDY
413.49524.322030209 182.7871.95

GONZALES V. HJ HEINZ
2,851.373,952.352030210 3,286.012,185.03

GONZALES V. HORMEL FOODS
1,469.471,527.932030212 94.4435.98

GONZALES V. INGRAM 
ENTERTAINMENT

11,661.8715,544.662030215 4,811.61928.82

GONZALES V. JIMMY DEAN FOODS
1,289.471,448.202030219 337.55178.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. M&M MARS
1,129.271,291.162030230 665.56503.67

GONZALES V. MEAD JOHNSON 
FORMULA

1,807.811,825.802030239 17.990.00

GONZALES V. MINUTE MAID
718.88844.132030242 2,902.832,777.58

GONZALES V. MISSION FOODS
2,639.912,784.732030245 216.7771.95

GONZALES V. MOREY'S SEAFOOD
254.75331.202030248 76.450.00

GONZALES V. REDDY ICE CORP.
2,613.562,716.582030272 174.9771.95

GONZALES V. ROYAL/JUAREZ DISTRIB.
921.941,122.852030280 501.42300.51

GONZALES V. S.C. JOHNSON & CO.
425.37443.362030281 17.990.00

GONZALES V. SANTA FE TORTILLA CO.
2,222.472,362.002030284 211.4871.95

GONZALES V. SEVEN UP/RC BOTTLING
3,279.134,543.612030290 1,458.12193.64

GONZALES V. TOPCO
12,458.9012,798.952030300 340.050.00

GONZALES V. TREE OF LIFE 
SOUTHWEST

2,234.752,572.572030307 919.79581.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

GONZALES V. UNILEVER HOME AND
1,116.051,494.722030311 694.52315.85

GONZALES V. WISCONSINS FINEST
2,121.792,156.712030320 196.81161.89

22,216.12 100,294.87 42,388.13120,466.88Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 5

04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

PREFERENCE ACTIONS ADMINISTRATIONRE:
FURRS SUPERMARKETS INC.

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $18,050.53

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter from David Grammer re: review of 
depositions. [L327]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

45.00Update status memo to Chris Pierce. [L444]04/02/2004 ADG 0.30
153.00Review of calendar, files re: hearings on settlements, 

payment plans. [L194]
04/06/2004 CWP 0.90

170.00Court appearance for hearing on payment plans, 
status; Conference with Tom Walker re: results. 
[L459]

04/06/2004 CWP 1.00

45.00Status conference with D&P attorneys. [L195]04/06/2004 ADG 0.30
165.00Status conference. [L195]04/08/2004 CMT 1.10
105.00Confer with Davis & Pierce Furr's attorneys about 

pending matters and case status. [L195]
04/13/2004 ADG 0.70

50.00Meeting with C. Pierce, A. Goodman, P. Barber and 
C. Tessman re: status. [L195]

04/13/2004 MCG 0.40

60.00Meet with CWP, ADG, PDB, and MCG.  re: case 
management. [L195]

04/13/2004 CMT 0.40

45.00Update spreadsheet. [L143]04/14/2004 CMT 0.30
15.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman regarding 

warehouse inventory. [L195]
04/15/2004 ADG 0.10

150.00Meeting with C. Tessman, reviewed inventory, 
reviewed documents to determine additional source 
document needs. [L142]

04/15/2004 MCG 1.20

25.00Meeting with C. Tessman re: documents. [L325]04/16/2004 MCG 0.20
34.00Conference with Paul Barber, William F. Davis re: 

entry of appearance for Thuma. [L115]
04/16/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from Anne Goodman re: documents, 
bank records. [L144]

04/16/2004 CWP 0.20
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04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

45.00Status conference with Chris Pierce, Cynthia 
Tessman, Marisol Garcia, and Paul Barber. [L125]

04/20/2004 ADG 0.30

62.50Meeting with C. Pierce, C. Tessman, P. Barber and 
A. Goodman re: status. [L195]

04/20/2004 MCG 0.50

150.00Reviewed documents at R. Kefauver's office. [L144]04/20/2004 MCG 1.20
85.00Conference with all attorneys re: status, deadlines, 

pre-petition interest, motions, "relation back" issue. 
[L195]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.50

119.00Conference with Anne Goodman, Marisol Garcia, 
Cynthia Tessman re: status, forms of order, requests 
for pre-petition interest, amendment to claims; 
Review of form of motion. [L115]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.70

75.00Meeting with CWP, ADG, MCG, and PDB re: 
scheduling of cases. [L145]

04/20/2004 CMT 0.50

15.00Review e-mail from Colleen. [L198]04/20/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review motion to amend complaint. [L254]04/20/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Telephone conference with Colleen. [L198]04/20/2004 CMT 0.10
12.50Meeting with C. Tessman and A. Goodman re: 

documents. [L195]
04/22/2004 MCG 0.10

37.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: amending complaints to 
add interest. [L195]

04/27/2004 MCG 0.30

30.00Review miscellaneous Furr's financial documents. 
[L114]

04/28/2004 ADG 0.20

60.00Update memo to Chris Pierce regarding pending 
cases. [L195]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.40

15.00Draft e-mail to Cynthia Tessman regarding 
administrative spreadsheet. [L195]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.10

75.00Update spreadsheet. [L1910]04/29/2004 CMT 0.50
15.00Review e-mail from ADG re: cases. [L145]04/29/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Update Spreadsheet. [L1410]04/29/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 2,001.5013.50
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04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
64.00Copy Charges [E101]04/01/2004

2.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/01/2004
2.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/01/2004
0.20Long Distance Phone charge [E105]04/01/2004
2.85Long Distance Phone charge [E105]04/01/2004

13.25Copy Charges [E101]04/02/2004
8.00Copy Charges [E101]04/02/2004
2.58Postage Charges [E108]04/02/2004
8.50Postage Charges [E108]04/02/2004
1.75Postage Charges [E108]04/02/2004
4.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/02/2004
0.50Copy Charges [E101]04/05/2004
0.37Postage Charges [E108]04/05/2004

13.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/06/2004
0.25Copy Charges [E101]04/08/2004
0.37Postage Charges. [E108]04/08/2004
3.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/08/2004
5.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/09/2004
3.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/12/2004
1.25Copy Charges [E101]04/13/2004
0.60Postage Charges [E103]04/13/2004
6.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/13/2004
0.50Copy Charges. [E101]04/14/2004

128.00Copy Charges [E101]04/14/2004
0.37Postage Charges [E108]04/14/2004
6.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/16/2004
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04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

94.72Postage Charge. [E108]04/18/2004
66.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/20/2004

9.00Copy Charges [E101]04/23/2004
1.25Copy Charges [E101]04/23/2004
4.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/23/2004
4.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/23/2004
4.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/23/2004

22.00Telefax Charges [E104]04/23/2004
0.37Postage Charge. [E108]04/23/2004
0.60Postage Charge. [E108]04/23/2004

25.75Copy Charges [E101]04/26/2004
17.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/26/2004

4.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/27/2004
4.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
2.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
2.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
2.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
4.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
4.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/28/2004
3.00Telefax Charge [E104]04/29/2004

37.00Copy Charge. [E101]04/29/2004
55.00First National Bank - Research & Copies. [E118]04/30/2004

Total of New Expenses: 643.03

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement (expenses). 1,311.2304/27/2004
Payment on March 2004 statement. 2,125.6304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order 
(expense).

0.0304/28/2004
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04/30/2004
CWP-1120038

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 11,019.5304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 14,456.42

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

360.00ADG 2.40 150.00Anne Goodman
525.00CMT 3.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman
629.00CWP 3.70 170.00Chris Pierce
487.50MCG 3.90 125.00Marisol Garcia

$14,456.42NEW PAYMENTS:
$643.03NEW EXPENSES:

$2,001.50NEW SERVICES:
$18,050.53PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $116.34

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,760.87TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$6,354.98
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030138

GONZALES V. ALLIED SUPPLY CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,502.57

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: status 
conference. [L234]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
payments. [L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 102.000.60

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
4.50Long Distance Phone charge04/01/2004

Total of New Expenses: 4.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 249.9804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,040.4304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,290.41
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030138

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

102.00CWP 0.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,290.41NEW PAYMENTS:
$4.50NEW EXPENSES:

$102.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,502.57PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $5.93

CURRENT BALANCE:
$112.43TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$324.59
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030143

GONZALES V. AMERICAN PROMOTIONALRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $6,323.90

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conference with Joe Jameson re: 
corrections, transcript. [L338]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: cost bill, 
experts, fees. [L465]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

102.00Review of Defendant's reply brief on Motion for New 
Trial. [L464]

04/19/2004 CWP 0.60

34.00Review of defendant's response to motion to tax 
costs. [L464]

04/23/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of letter from clerk re: cost bill. [L468]04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 238.001.40

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
495.19Court Reporter Fee - Transcripts of Proceedings 

taken on Oct 1-2, 2003. [E116]
04/09/2004

Total of New Expenses: 495.19

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 1,669.7204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 4,088.6004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 5,758.32
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030143

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

238.00CWP 1.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$5,758.32NEW PAYMENTS:
$495.19NEW EXPENSES:
$238.00NEW SERVICES:

$6,323.90PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $13.83

CURRENT BALANCE:
$747.02TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,312.60
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030146

GONZALES V. ANDERSON NEWSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,431.51

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 902.3204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,071.8804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,974.20

$1,974.20NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$3,431.51PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,457.31
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030152

GONZALES V. AZAR NUT COMPANYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,606.96

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review file. [L1410]04/15/2004 CMT 0.20
272.00Review of file, case law, responses to discovery re: 

PACA, ordinary course defenses; Legal research for 
judicial deference, PACA. [L444]

04/23/2004 CWP 1.60

51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
extension, status; Telephone conference with judge's 
clerk; Conference with Cynthia Tessman re: order. 
[L197]

04/26/2004 CWP 0.30

15.00Meet with CWP. [L125]04/27/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with CWP. [L195]04/28/2004 CMT 0.10
85.00Legal research for expert witness on PACA; search 

web for same. [L444]
04/29/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Reviewed and revised extension order, email to 
opposing attorney(s). [L393]

04/29/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Telephone conference with Judge's office re: hearing 
dates. [L198]

04/29/2004 CMT 0.20

15.00Meet with CWP re: trial dates. [L195]04/29/2004 CMT 0.10
75.00Draft Amended PTO. [L253]04/29/2004 CMT 0.50
34.00Review of email, fax from opposing attorney(s) 

approving order; Reviewed and revised same and 
email to Court. [L393]

04/30/2004 CWP 0.20

15.00Review fax re: approval. [L144]04/30/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with CWP re: order. [L195]04/30/2004 CMT 0.10

Total of New Services: 703.004.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 170.6204/27/2004
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030152

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,219.6804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,390.30

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

210.00CMT 1.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman
493.00CWP 2.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,390.30NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$703.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,606.96PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $40.86

CURRENT BALANCE:
$743.86TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$960.52
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030158

GONZALES V. BUNZL USARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,692.02

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
discovery; Preparation of response letter re: experts, 
disclosure, discovery. [L317]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Telephone conference with Keith Aurzada re: Dennis 
Lavin, expert testimony; Review of expert report; 
Left message with Dennis Lavin re: same. [L348]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: discovery, 
experts, disclosure. [L345]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

204.00Review of file, documents; email Rachel re: 
spreadsheets; Review of spreadsheet re: recalculation; 
Preparation of letter to opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement; Reviewed and revised same; Legal 
research for same; approve for mailing. [L163]

04/01/2004 CWP 1.20

34.00Conference with William F. Davis re: Dennis Lavin, 
expert, hiring, trial. [L345]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

15.00Review expert designation letter, conference with 
Chris Pierce. [L345]

04/01/2004 ADG 0.10

34.00Review of notices of deposition, letter from opposing 
attorney(s). [L331]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status, deadlines. [L144]04/02/2004 ADG 0.20
119.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 

mediation, discovery; email to Yvette Gonzales re: 
same; Review of email re: same. [L166]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.70

51.00Review of letters from opposing attorney(s) re: expert 
witnesses, offer, mediation, order. [L344]

04/07/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
mediation, documents, depositions. [L337]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.20
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030158

68.00Review of fax from opposing attorney(s) re: 
mediation order; Preparation of letter to opposing 
attorney(s); Telephone conference with opposing 
attorney(s) re: approval of order. [L143]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.40

25.00Draft letter to Louis Puccini regarding extension of 
settlement offer deadline. [L143]

04/15/2004 JG 0.50

34.00Review of filed mediation order; Review of file re: 
settlement status. [L164]

04/21/2004 CWP 0.20

255.00Review of email from Rachel Kefauver re: 
deposition; Review of files, documents, 
correspondence, previous document production re: 
response to subpoena; Preparation of additional 
documents, exhibits, copies for deposition; Left 
message with opposing attorney(s). [L331]

04/23/2004 CWP 1.50

30.00Status conference with Chris Pierce. [L415]04/27/2004 ADG 0.20
102.00Review of documents, exhibits; Telephone 

conferences with opposing attorney(s) re: 
postponement, extensions, mediation; Telephone 
conference with Yvette Gonzales re: approval. [L336]

04/27/2004 CWP 0.60

34.00Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: deposition 
scheduling; email to Rachel Kefauver, Buz Doyle re: 
same. [L337]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Conference with William F. Davis re: mediator; 
Letter to opposing attorney(s) re: same. [L167]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) re: 
mediator. [L167]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of proposed order extending trial, deadlines; 
approve for faxing back to opposing attorney(s). 
[L254]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review proposed stipulated order and deadlines. 
[L1910]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.20

Total of New Services: 1,388.008.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030158

Payment on March 2004 statement. 1,194.3604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,230.8304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,425.19

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

105.00ADG 0.70 150.00Anne Goodman
1,258.00CWP 7.40 170.00Chris Pierce

25.00JG 0.50 50.00Jina Garcia

$3,425.19NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,388.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,692.02PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $80.68

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,468.68TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$2,735.51
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030159

GONZALES V. C&H SUGARRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $798.35

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
settlement. [L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 68.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 172.2104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 417.4204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 589.63
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030159

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$589.63NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$68.00NEW SERVICES:
$798.35PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.95

CURRENT BALANCE:
$71.95TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$280.67
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030163

GONZALES V. CAMPBELL SALES CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $602.88

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 526.4304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 526.43

$526.43NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$602.88PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$76.45
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030164

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - DEMINGRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,052.05

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Review status, deadlines. [L194]04/02/2004 ADG 0.10
60.00Prepare Trustee's Supplemental Responses to 

Defendant's First Set of Requests for Production of 
Documents and Certificate of Mailing. [L143]

04/02/2004 JG 1.20

34.00Conference with Jina Garcia re: preparation of order 
continuing status conference; Reviewed and revised 
same; approve for fax to opposing attorney(s). [L257]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

25.00Prepare Stipulated Order Continuing Status 
Conference. [L143]

04/09/2004 JG 0.50

51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
approval of order, stipulations; Reviewed and revised 
order on hearing and email to Court. [L447]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.30

15.00Review status. [L1910]04/29/2004 ADG 0.10

Total of New Services: 200.002.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 94.4404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 910.2604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,004.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 24

04/30/2004
CWP-2030164

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00ADG 0.20 150.00Anne Goodman
85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce
85.00JG 1.70 50.00Jina Garcia

$1,004.70NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$200.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,052.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $11.63

CURRENT BALANCE:
$211.63TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$258.98



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030169

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - ENTERPRISESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $7,258.48

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

170.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: financials; 
Telephone conference with David Thuma re: 
exhibits; Preparation of supplemental response to 
requests for production. [L324]

04/01/2004 CWP 1.00

180.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding documents to 
be produced to defendant (.1).  Assemble documents 
(1.1). [L324]

04/01/2004 ADG 1.20

85.00Reviewed and revised exhibits, certificate of service; 
approval of filing electronically. [L324]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.50

30.00Review status, deadlines. [L190]04/02/2004 ADG 0.20
75.00Review prepaid payment information, spreadsheets. 

[L114]
04/02/2004 ADG 0.50

690.00Review defendants' documents pertaining to 
advertising program, draft memo to Chris Pierce. 
[L114]

04/09/2004 ADG 4.60

390.00Further review of Coca Cola documents. [L114]04/11/2004 ADG 2.60
75.00Review prepaid spreadsheets. [L114]04/12/2004 ADG 0.50

870.00Review defendants' documents, draft memo to Chris 
Pierce regarding advertising program, related 
payments and accounting. [L114]

04/12/2004 ADG 5.80

135.00Review defendants' documents pertaining to 
$120,000 payment to Magnolia, review Furr's bank 
statements. [L114]

04/13/2004 ADG 0.90

45.00Draft letter to Joe Johnson regarding Magnolia check. 
[L118]

04/13/2004 ADG 0.30

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding Magnolia 
check. [L115]

04/13/2004 ADG 0.20

75.00Legal research pertaining to advertising payments. 
[L122]

04/13/2004 ADG 0.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030169

60.00Review new value calculations. [L114]04/13/2004 ADG 0.40
68.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: discovery, status 

of canceled checks, claims of NSF checks; Telephone 
conference with Joe Johnson re: CCE checks, status. 
[L327]

04/13/2004 CWP 0.40

30.00Review witness list. [L253]04/14/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding advertising 

program. [L325]
04/15/2004 ADG 0.10

34.00Review of defendant's 3rd amended witness list. 
[L114]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.20

630.00Review Furr's source documents relating to prepaid 
claims. [L114]

04/21/2004 ADG 4.20

30.00Review last witness list filed to see if it needs to be 
updated. [L254]

04/21/2004 CMT 0.20

120.00Review Furr's documents pertaining to post-petition 
wire transfer payments. [L114]

04/22/2004 ADG 0.80

15.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman regarding copying 
of documents. [L325]

04/23/2004 ADG 0.10

75.00Review Furr's documents relating to prepaid claims. 
[L324]

04/23/2004 ADG 0.50

119.00Review of spreadsheets re: settlement offer; 
Reviewed and revised letter; email to Rachel 
Kefauver re: recalculation of new value re: 
"marketing agreement" payments. [L164]

04/23/2004 CWP 0.70

374.00Review of emails from Rachel Kefauver, amended 
spreadsheets with new value recalculated; Review of 
discovery responses re: admissions, emails on credit 
hold, catch up plan, COD, communications on 
collections, ordinary course; Reviewed and revised 
settlement letter. [L164]

04/26/2004 CWP 2.20

30.00Status conference with Chris Pierce. [L125]04/27/2004 ADG 0.20
75.00Review Furr's wire transfer statements pertaining to 

prepaid payments. [L234]
04/28/2004 ADG 0.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030169

34.00Telephone conference with Catherine Harrison re: 
discovery, deadlines, extension, settlement, order. 
[L397]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

68.00Review of order prepared by opposing attorney(s); 
email opposing attorney(s) re: approval; Review of 
emails from Court re:same. [L394]

04/28/2004 CWP 0.40

30.00Review status. [L1910]04/29/2004 ADG 0.20
15.00Review fax from Fairfield Bank regarding check 

information. [L114]
04/29/2004 ADG 0.10

187.00Review of spreadsheets re: bounced check; Reviewed 
and revised settlement offer; email to Rachel 
Kefauver re: amended spreadsheets; Conference with 
Anne Goodman re: same. [L164]

04/29/2004 CWP 1.10

Total of New Services: 4,859.0031.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 1,907.0104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 4,206.0604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 6,113.07



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030169

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

3,660.00ADG 24.40 150.00Anne Goodman
60.00CMT 0.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman

1,139.00CWP 6.70 170.00Chris Pierce

$6,113.07NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$4,859.00NEW SERVICES:
$7,258.48PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $282.43

CURRENT BALANCE:
$5,141.43TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$6,286.84



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030176

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - PHOENIXRE:
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Telephone conference with Joe Johnson regarding 
check information received from Fairfield Bank. 
[L117]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.20

30.00Telephone conference with Amy Oakley at Fairfield 
Bank regarding possible NSF check. [L118]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.20

45.00Review prepaid documents for production to 
defendants. [L324]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.30

Total of New Services: 105.000.70

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

105.00ADG 0.70 150.00Anne Goodman

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$105.00NEW SERVICES:
$0.00PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $6.10

CURRENT BALANCE:
$111.10TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$111.10



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030179

GONZALES V. COCA COLA - SANTA FERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $840.13

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Conference with Les King re: continuance; 
Conference with Jina Garcia re: preparation of order 
continuing status conference; Reviewed and revised 
same; approve for fax to opposing attorney(s). [L257]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.30

25.00Prepare Stipulated Order Continuing Status 
Conference. [L143]

04/09/2004 JG 0.50

34.00Revise scheduling order and email to Court. [L313]04/12/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of signed scheduling order. [L314]04/13/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Meet with CWP re: new value defense. [L125]04/13/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 174.001.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 199.9904/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 565.5504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 765.54



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030179

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00CMT 0.20 150.00Cynthia Tessman
119.00CWP 0.70 170.00Chris Pierce

25.00JG 0.50 50.00Jina Garcia

$765.54NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$174.00NEW SERVICES:
$840.13PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $10.11

CURRENT BALANCE:
$184.11TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$258.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030188

GONZALES V. DEAN FOODS, INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $5,460.18

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
witness disclosure; Reviewed and revised order and 
email to opposing attorney(s). [L414]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status, deadlines. [L194]04/02/2004 ADG 0.20
34.00Review of file re: schedule, deadlines; email to 

opposing attorney(s) re: same. [L397]
04/07/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
discovery order. [L314]

04/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
approval of order; Revision to same and email to 
court. [L313]

04/13/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of signed order on deadlines. [L314]04/14/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 

extension request, discovery. [L314]
04/20/2004 CWP 0.20

136.00Review of file, settlement offer re: facts, depositions, 
discovery planning, witnesses; Legal research for 
defenses. [L394]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.80

555.00Review source documents relating to prepaid claims. 
[L114]

04/21/2004 ADG 3.70

120.00Review Furr's documents pertaining to post-petition 
wire transfer payments. [L114]

04/22/2004 ADG 0.80

102.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
scheduling; Telephone conference with Jill Peterson 
re: trial date; Preparation of order resulting from 
pretrial conference; email to opposing attorney(s). 
[L314]

04/22/2004 CWP 0.60

15.00Conference with Cynthia Tessman regarding 
documents to be copied. [L325]

04/23/2004 ADG 0.10

105.00Review Furr's documents supporting prepaid claims. 
[L114]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030188

30.00Review status, deadlines. [L1910]04/29/2004 ADG 0.20
45.00Review documents for production to defendants on 

prepaid claims. [L324]
04/29/2004 ADG 0.30

Total of New Services: 1,342.008.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 1,035.6404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,371.5204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,407.16

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

900.00ADG 6.00 150.00Anne Goodman
442.00CWP 2.60 170.00Chris Pierce

$3,407.16NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,342.00NEW SERVICES:
$5,460.18PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $78.00

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,420.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$3,473.02



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 34

04/30/2004
CWP-2030197

GONZALES V. DPI FOOD PRODUCTSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,042.05

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,746.4404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,746.44

$1,746.44NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$2,042.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$295.61



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030204

GONZALES V. FLOWERS - EL PASORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $741.75

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 732.7504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 732.75

$732.75NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$741.75PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$9.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030206

GONZALES V. FOOD MARKETING GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,411.57

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

136.00Review of file re: facts, status, American Promotional 
effect on case; Telephone conference with Linda 
Bloom re: same, summary judgment; Letter to 
opposing attorney(s) re: American Promotional 
Ruling. [L124]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.80

136.00Review of summary judgment documents, witness 
lists; Review of court website re: status of summary 
judgment ruling; Review of exhibits re: dates of 
payment, affidavits, new value and ordinary course 
argument. [L124]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.80

187.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: status, summary 
judgment; Legal research for defenses; Review of 
checks, Fed'Ex records, wire transfer records; begin 
preparation of trial exhibit list. [L441]

04/15/2004 CWP 1.10

Total of New Services: 459.002.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 358.7004/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 3,864.0004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 4,222.70



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030206

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

459.00CWP 2.70 170.00Chris Pierce

$4,222.70NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$459.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,411.57PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $26.68

CURRENT BALANCE:
$485.68TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$674.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030208

GONZALES V. GERBER PRODUCTS CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $366.12

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of letter, approved orders from Defendant. 
[L167]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Reviewed and revised order approving compromise; 
email to Court. [L163]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of signed settlement order. [L164]04/02/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status 

conference. [L234]
04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of email from Susan MacTye re: orders, 

mailing of check. [L164]
04/13/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of check from Gerber; Letter to Yvette 
Gonzales. [L164]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Reviewed and revised dismissal order and email to 
court; Review of signed order. [L163]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 289.001.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 212.6804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 48.6804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 261.36



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030208

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

289.00CWP 1.70 170.00Chris Pierce

$261.36NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$289.00NEW SERVICES:
$366.12PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $16.80

CURRENT BALANCE:
$305.80TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$410.56



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030209

GONZALES V. HOLIDAY CANDYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $524.32

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status. 
[L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 68.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 332.5204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 80.9704/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 413.49



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030209

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$413.49NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$68.00NEW SERVICES:
$524.32PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.95

CURRENT BALANCE:
$71.95TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$182.78



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030210

GONZALES V. HJ HEINZRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,952.35

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Review status, deadlines. [L194]04/02/2004 ADG 0.10
187.00Review of settlement letter, proposed response to 

motion to amend pleadings; Legal research for cases 
cited in response. [L122]

04/06/2004 CWP 1.10

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
proposed settlement. [L167]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Email to opposing attorney(s) re: status of analysis; 
Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: same. 
[L167]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

255.00Legal research for motion to amend (analyze all cases 
cited by Defendant, and search for other cases on 
point). [L142]

04/14/2004 CWP 1.50

34.00Telephone conference with Yvette Gonzales  re: 
settlement, motion to amend, defenses. [L126]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Conference with William F. Davis re: motion to 
amend, defenses, strategy. [L125]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.30

119.00Review of case law, facts re: motion to amend; 
Review of settlement agreement in other case; 
Review of discovery. [L434]

04/15/2004 CWP 0.70

272.00Review of file, cases, correspondence, exhibits, 
docket, discovery responses re: settlement. [L434]

04/16/2004 CWP 1.60

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding motion for 
clarification. [L215]

04/22/2004 ADG 0.20

60.00Review motion to clarify or amend. [L214]04/22/2004 ADG 0.40
30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding motion to 

amend. [L215]
04/22/2004 ADG 0.20

595.00Review of file, cases, spreadsheets, research, and 
review and revise motion for clarification or to file 
1st amended complaint, exhibits, 1st Amended 
Complaint, and letter to opposing attorney(s). [L253]

04/22/2004 CWP 3.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 43

04/30/2004
CWP-2030210

68.00Reviewed and revised notices of deposition; approve 
mailing of letter, filing of motions. [L333]

04/23/2004 CWP 0.40

30.00Status conference with Chris Pierce. [L125]04/27/2004 ADG 0.20
51.00Letter to court reporter re: fees; Telephone 

conferences with hotel re: conference room. [L331]
04/28/2004 CWP 0.30

30.00Review status, deadlines. [L1910]04/29/2004 ADG 0.20
170.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 

settlement, rescheduling depositions; Telephone 
conference with Yvette Gonzales re: same; 
Preparation of letter to opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement offer. [L167]

04/29/2004 CWP 1.00

Total of New Services: 2,065.0012.30

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
450.00POWERS, GARRISON & HUGHES04/29/2004

-450.00POWERS, GARRISON & HUGHES04/29/2004

Total of New Expenses: 0.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 2,201.4304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 649.9404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,851.37



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 44

04/30/2004
CWP-2030210

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

195.00ADG 1.30 150.00Anne Goodman
1,870.00CWP 11.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,851.37NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,065.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,952.35PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $120.03

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,185.03TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$3,286.01



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030212

GONZALES V. HORMEL FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,527.93

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: dismissal, settlement conference; 
Telephone conference with Jill Peterson re: vacating 
hearing. [L234]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 121.4204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,348.0504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,469.47



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030212

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,469.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,527.93PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$94.44



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 47

04/30/2004
CWP-2030215

GONZALES V. INGRAM ENTERTAINMENTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $15,544.66

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

68.00Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel; 
Reviewing correspondence from court reporters re 
deposition. [L337]

04/02/2004 PDB 0.40

102.00Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel; 
preparing correspondence. [L337]

04/07/2004 PDB 0.60

204.00Preparing for and appearing at pretrial conference. 
[L451]

04/13/2004 PDB 1.20

68.00Telephone conversation with witness re deposition 
schedule. [L138]

04/28/2004 PDB 0.40

Total of New Services: 442.002.60

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
461.13Court Reporter Fee - Deposition of R. Kefauver, K. 

Fine, W. Doyle taken on March 17-18, 2004. [E115]
04/09/2004

Total of New Expenses: 461.13

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 4,315.5604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 7,346.3104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 11,661.87



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030215

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

442.00PDB 2.60 170.00Paul Barber

$11,661.87NEW PAYMENTS:
$461.13NEW EXPENSES:
$442.00NEW SERVICES:

$15,544.66PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $25.69

CURRENT BALANCE:
$928.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$4,811.61



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030219

GONZALES V. JIMMY DEAN FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,448.20

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of order approving settlement. [L164]04/12/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Review docket for status of order. [L254]04/15/2004 CMT 0.20
60.00Draft order to dismiss. [L253]04/26/2004 CMT 0.40
15.00E-mail opposing counsel re: order. [L258]04/26/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review e-mail from opposing counsel. [L258]04/26/2004 CMT 0.20

Total of New Services: 169.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 178.5604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,110.9104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,289.47



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030219

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

135.00CMT 0.90 150.00Cynthia Tessman
34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,289.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$169.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,448.20PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $9.82

CURRENT BALANCE:
$178.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$337.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030230

GONZALES V. M&M MARSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,291.16

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

238.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel 
telephone conversation with court staff; conferring 
with Mr. Pierce; reviewing file. [L167]

04/06/2004 PDB 1.40

238.00Preparing pleadings, settlement documents; preparing 
correspondence to opposing counsel. [L167]

04/26/2004 PDB 1.40

Total of New Services: 476.002.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 404.7304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 724.5404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,129.27



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030230

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

476.00PDB 2.80 170.00Paul Barber

$1,129.27NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$476.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,291.16PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $27.67

CURRENT BALANCE:
$503.67TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$665.56



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 53

04/30/2004
CWP-2030239

GONZALES V. MEAD JOHNSON FORMULARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,825.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,807.8104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,807.81

$1,807.81NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,825.80PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$17.99



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030242

GONZALES V. MINUTE MAIDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $844.13

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

153.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s); Review 
of file, analyze settlement offer, spreadsheet; email to 
Rachel Kefauver re: same. [L114]

04/06/2004 CWP 0.90

25.00Telephone conference with J. Lewis re: settlement. 
Sending letter. [L114]

04/06/2004 MCG 0.20

204.00Review of file, documents re: settlement, trial; 
Review of exhibits re: same; Legal research for 
defenses. [L444]

04/07/2004 CWP 1.20

34.00Telephone conference with Rachel Kefauver re: 
amended exhibit, status of exhibits, proof. [L448]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Review of email from Rachel Kefauver, spreadsheet, 
proof. [L444]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.30

100.00Meeting with C. Tessman re: documents for trial. 
[L445]

04/13/2004 MCG 0.80

357.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: trial preparation, 
exhibits, witnesses; Review and revise exhibits, 
exhibit list. [L443]

04/13/2004 CWP 2.10

75.00Meet with MCG; re: exhibits. [L445]04/13/2004 CMT 0.50
120.00Meet with MCG; re: exhibits. [L445]04/13/2004 CMT 0.80

85.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: latest form of 
exhibit book; Review of same. [L444]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.50

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
extension, settlement. [L447]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

68.00Preparation of email to opposing attorney(s) re: 
spreadsheet, calculations; Reviewed and revised 
same. [L443]

04/14/2004 CWP 0.40

150.00Review documents; assist in the preparation of 
exhibits. [L4411]

04/14/2004 CMT 1.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 55

04/30/2004
CWP-2030242

595.00Reviewed and revised trial exhibits; Preparation for 
trial; approve exhibits for faxing to opposing 
attorney(s). [L161]

04/19/2004 CWP 3.50

30.00Meet with MCG. re: bank records. [L445]04/20/2004 CMT 0.20
544.00Review of email with settlement offer; Conferences 

with Yvette Gonzales, Marisol Garcia, William F. 
Davis; Preparation of settlement response; Reviewed 
and revised same; Review of response; email 
response; Telephone conference with Court re: 
vacated hearing; Preparation of first draft of 
documents. [L161]

04/21/2004 CWP 3.20

Total of New Services: 2,625.0016.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 19.8404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 699.0404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 718.88



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 56

04/30/2004
CWP-2030242

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

375.00CMT 2.50 150.00Cynthia Tessman
2,125.00CWP 12.50 170.00Chris Pierce

125.00MCG 1.00 125.00Marisol Garcia

$718.88NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$2,625.00NEW SERVICES:
$844.13PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $152.58

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,777.58TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$2,902.83



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030245

GONZALES V. MISSION FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,784.73

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Reviewed and revised order dismissing case; email to 
Court. [L213]

04/06/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of signed order of dismissal from Court. 
[L444]

04/07/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 68.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 253.1604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,386.7504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,639.91



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030245

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,639.91NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$68.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,784.73PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.95

CURRENT BALANCE:
$71.95TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$216.77



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030248

GONZALES V. MOREY'S SEAFOODRE:
INTERNATIONAL

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $331.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 121.4204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 133.3304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 254.75

$254.75NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$331.20PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$76.45



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030272

GONZALES V. REDDY ICE CORP.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,716.58

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status. 
[L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 68.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 100.7904/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,512.7704/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,613.56



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030272

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,613.56NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$68.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,716.58PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.95

CURRENT BALANCE:
$71.95TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$174.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030280

GONZALES V. ROYAL/JUAREZ DISTRIB.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,122.85

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

12.50Left message for A. Rocha re: settlement offer. 
[L168]

04/06/2004 MCG 0.10

12.50Left message for A. Rocha re: settlement. [L168]04/06/2004 MCG 0.10
12.50Left message for  A. Rocha re: settlement. [L168]04/06/2004 MCG 0.10
12.50Left message for A. Rocha re: settlement offer. 

[L167]
04/13/2004 MCG 0.10

12.50Left message for A. Rocha. [L167]04/13/2004 MCG 0.10
25.00Telephone conference with Mary re:  final pretrial 

conference and trial dates. [L198]
04/13/2004 MCG 0.20

25.00Telephone conference with Jill re: trial dates and 
order. [L198]

04/13/2004 MCG 0.20

12.50Left message for A. Rocha. [L167]04/13/2004 MCG 0.10
37.50Telephone conference with A. Rocha re: settlement. 

[L167]
04/14/2004 MCG 0.30

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: settlement. [L167]04/14/2004 MCG 0.20
34.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: offer in writing. 

[L165]
04/14/2004 CWP 0.20

25.00Prepared Stipulated Order Resulting from Final 
Pretrial Conference. [L143]

04/27/2004 RB 0.50

37.50Reviewed Final Pretrial Order. [L213]04/27/2004 MCG 0.30

Total of New Services: 284.002.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 227.7604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 694.1804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 921.94



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 63

04/30/2004
CWP-2030280

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce
225.00MCG 1.80 125.00Marisol Garcia

25.00RB 0.50 50.00Renee Baca

$921.94NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$284.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,122.85PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $16.51

CURRENT BALANCE:
$300.51TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$501.42



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030281

GONZALES V. S.C. JOHNSON & CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $443.36

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 425.3704/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 425.37

$425.37NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$443.36PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$17.99



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030284

GONZALES V. SANTA FE TORTILLA CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,362.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
payments. [L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Court appearance for status conference. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 68.000.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 67.4604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,155.0104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,222.47



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 66

04/30/2004
CWP-2030284

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,222.47NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$68.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,362.00PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $3.95

CURRENT BALANCE:
$71.95TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$211.48



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030290

GONZALES V. SEVEN UP/RC BOTTLINGRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,543.61

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

68.00Review of message from opposing attorney(s) re: 
status; email to opposing attorney(s) re: procedure, 
settlement; Telephone conference with judge's clerk 
re: amended motion; Preparation of same. [L167]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.40

51.00Review of letter, signed settlement agreement from 
opposing attorney(s); approve for faxing to Yvette 
Gonzales. [L164]

04/19/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of signed settlement agreement from client; 
Letter to opposing attorney(s). [L167]

04/23/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status of settlement. [L164]04/29/2004 ADG 0.20

Total of New Services: 183.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 2,253.0104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,026.1204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 3,279.13



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 68

04/30/2004
CWP-2030290

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

30.00ADG 0.20 150.00Anne Goodman
153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$3,279.13NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$183.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,543.61PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $10.64

CURRENT BALANCE:
$193.64TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,458.12



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 69

04/30/2004
CWP-2030300

GONZALES V. TOPCORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $12,798.95

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 67.4604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 12,391.4404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 12,458.90

$12,458.90NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$12,798.95PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$340.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030307

GONZALES V. TREE OF LIFE SOUTHWESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,572.57

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

125.00Prepare Motion to Approve Settlement, Notice of 
Deadline to Object to Motion, Settlement Agreement 
and Mutual Release, Order Approving Settlement, 
and Order Dismissing Adversary. [L143]

04/02/2004 JG 2.50

204.00Telephone conference with Tom Walker re: 
settlement; Review of settlement agreement; revise 
same; Reviewed and revised all settlement 
documents; email to Tom Walker re: same; email to 
opposing attorney(s). [L163]

04/06/2004 CWP 1.20

51.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement agreement, agreement with form of 
motions, order; email settlement agreement to 
opposing attorney(s). [L167]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: signed 
settlement agreement. [L167]

04/16/2004 CWP 0.20

85.00Reviewed and revised motion, notice for settlement 
and prepare for filing of same; approve for filing. 
[L163]

04/19/2004 CWP 0.50

51.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s), signed 
settlement agreement; Letter to Yvette Gonzales re: 
same. [L166]

04/22/2004 CWP 0.30

Total of New Services: 550.005.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 741.6104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,493.1404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,234.75



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 71

04/30/2004
CWP-2030307

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

425.00CWP 2.50 170.00Chris Pierce
125.00JG 2.50 50.00Jina Garcia

$2,234.75NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$550.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,572.57PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $31.97

CURRENT BALANCE:
$581.97TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$919.79



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030311

GONZALES V. UNILEVER HOME ANDRE:
PERSONAL

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,494.72

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

68.00Review of file re: status of consolidation; Legal 
research for same. [L444]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.40

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status. 
[L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Meet with CWP and MCG, re: motion to amend. 

[L255]
04/20/2004 CMT 0.20

12.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: Motion to consolidate. 
[L195]

04/27/2004 MCG 0.10

15.00Meet with CWP re: scheduling. [L195]04/27/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Meet with MCG, re:motion to amend. [L195]04/27/2004 CMT 0.10
90.00Draft Motion to Consolidate. [L253]04/29/2004 CMT 0.60

Total of New Services: 298.501.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 933.6604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 182.3904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,116.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030311

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

150.00CMT 1.00 150.00Cynthia Tessman
136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce

12.50MCG 0.10 125.00Marisol Garcia

$1,116.05NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$298.50NEW SERVICES:
$1,494.72PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $17.35

CURRENT BALANCE:
$315.85TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$694.52



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
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04/30/2004
CWP-2030320

GONZALES V. WISCONSINS FINESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,156.71

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
payments. [L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Court appearance for status conference. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20
51.00Review of settlement order and email to opposing 

attorney(s); Review of email approving same; email 
to court. [L437]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of signed order approving settlement. [L164]04/12/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 153.000.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 64.2804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,057.5104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,121.79



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 75

04/30/2004
CWP-2030320

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

153.00CWP 0.90 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,121.79NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$153.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,156.71PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.89

CURRENT BALANCE:
$161.89TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$196.81

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

04/30/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

PREPAID ADVERSARY 
ADMINISTRATION

2,635.913,577.241120043 4,279.713,338.38

A/R ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATION
184.38439.651120044 435.15179.88

AURORA FOODS - FROZEN
56.6288.3603110149 31.740.00

BEST FOODS
174.06229.8703110155 55.810.00

COCA COLA - DURANGO
365.85516.9003110167 151.050.00

COCA COLA - SANTA FE
67.45111.0903110179 43.640.00

EASTMAN KODAK
883.821,012.6403110200 164.8035.98

INTERNATIONAL HOME FOOD
111.11162.6903110218 51.580.00

JIMMY DEAN
379.86521.9103110219 142.050.00

LIPTON
738.05849.9403110227 414.51302.62

McNEIL CONSUMER HEALTHCARE
463.59579.9703110236 211.6195.23



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

04/30/2004
CWP-1120043

MEAD JOHNSON
188.62283.0503110239 94.430.00

MINUTE MAID
160.83223.5203110242 1,438.251,375.56

NATURAL WEATH VITAMINS
261.22324.7003110251 63.480.00

PEYTON MEATS
132.53201.5703110257 69.040.00

PLAYTEX (WOOLITE)
126.31207.6403110260 81.330.00

POMPEIAN INC.
174.59249.9803110263 91.2615.87

QUAKER OATS
132.94192.4503110266 59.510.00

QUAKER PASTA RONI RICE
196.42224.1903110269 27.770.00

ROSS LABORATORIES
371.14459.3503110278 88.210.00

S.C. JOHNSON
194.82276.2903110281 81.470.00

SEVEN UP / RC
198.14398.7803110290 236.6235.98

SHAMROCK FARMS
202.63218.5003110293 15.870.00

TROPICANA
152.11210.3003110308 58.190.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

04/30/2004
CWP-1120043

UNILEVER
152.76200.3803110311 47.620.00

WHITEHALL-ROBBINS
312.15363.7203110317 51.570.00

5,379.50 9,017.91 8,486.2712,124.68Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

04/30/2004
CWP-1120043

PREPAID ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,577.24

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

12.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: documents. [L145]04/01/2004 MCG 0.10
345.00Review documents for support for claims. [L144]04/01/2004 CMT 2.30
375.00REview boxes re: supporting documentation for 

claims. [L144]
04/02/2004 CMT 2.50

15.00Meet with MCG re: documents. [L145]04/02/2004 CMT 0.10
180.00Review boxes, review inventory lists, and meet with 

ADG and MCG. [L144]
04/15/2004 CMT 1.20

15.00Telephone conference with JTW re: missing boxes. 
[L147]

04/15/2004 CMT 0.10

30.00Telephone conference with Iron Mountain. [L148]04/15/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with Walker re: boxes. [L147]04/16/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with Monica re: boxes. [L148]04/16/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Return Telephone conference with Monica re: Rachel 

has the boxes. [L148]
04/16/2004 CMT 0.10

30.00Meet with MCG re: status of document. [L145]04/16/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00E-mail Rachel re: boxes. [L148]04/16/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Review e-mail from Rachel re: location of 

documents. [L148]
04/19/2004 CMT 0.10

25.00Meeting with C. Tessman re:post petition claims. 
[L125]

04/20/2004 MCG 0.20

12.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: post petition claims 
[L125]

04/20/2004 MCG 0.10

85.00Conference with Anne Goodman, Marisol Garcia, 
Cynthia Tessman re: status, forms of order, requests 
for pre-petition interest, amendment to claims. [L115]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.50

180.00Review files at Sage Accounting. [L144]04/20/2004 CMT 1.20
150.00Review documents. [L144]04/20/2004 CMT 1.00



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 5

04/30/2004
CWP-1120043

60.00Review files re: extensions requested. [L144]04/20/2004 CMT 0.40
30.00Meet with MCG, review status. [L145]04/20/2004 CMT 0.20

150.00Review complaints to determine which can be filed 
and if amendments need to be made. [L214]

04/22/2004 CMT 1.00

15.00Meet with ADG and MCG re: status. [L195]04/22/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Meet with ADG re: documents [L195]04/23/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Meet with MCG, re: documents. [L195]04/23/2004 CMT 0.20

105.00Review new files. [L194]04/23/2004 CMT 0.70
105.00Review files for source documents. [L144]04/23/2004 CMT 0.70

45.00Review spreadsheets to look for additional claims. 
[L192]

04/26/2004 CMT 0.30

60.00Review additional boxes from Iron Mountain. [L144]04/26/2004 CMT 0.40
45.00Meet with MCG re: amending complaints to include 

post-petition interest. [L195]
04/27/2004 CMT 0.30

90.00Review boxes from Iron Mountain. [L194]04/27/2004 CMT 0.60
225.00Reviewed documents. [L194]04/28/2004 MCG 1.80
105.00Review documents for source documents for claims. 

[L144]
04/28/2004 CMT 0.70

45.00Pull documents to determine if all post petition 
claims are being addressed. [L144]

04/29/2004 CMT 0.30

90.00Review source documents for claims. [L144]04/29/2004 CMT 0.60
75.00Review files for source documents. [L144]04/29/2004 CMT 0.50

125.00Meeting with C. Tessman re: complaints. [L195]04/30/2004 MCG 1.00
150.00Meet with MCG.  Review documents re: additional 

complaints, status of cases. [L195]
04/30/2004 CMT 1.00

15.00Meet with ADG re: status of claims. [L195]04/30/2004 CMT 0.10

Total of New Services: 3,155.0021.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 2,067.7104/27/2004



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 6

04/30/2004
CWP-1120043

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 568.2004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,635.91

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

2,670.00CMT 17.80 150.00Cynthia Tessman
85.00CWP 0.50 170.00Chris Pierce

400.00MCG 3.20 125.00Marisol Garcia

$2,635.91NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$3,155.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,577.24PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $183.38

CURRENT BALANCE:
$3,338.38TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$4,279.71



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 7

04/30/2004
CWP-1120044

A/R ADVERSARY ADMINISTRATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $439.65

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

170.00Telephone conference with Rachel Kefauver re: facts, 
evidence, witnesses; Conference with Cynthia 
Tessman re: contents of Iron Mountain boxes, 
evidence; Review of boxes re: same. [L114]

04/29/2004 CWP 1.00

Total of New Services: 170.001.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 148.4004/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 35.9804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 184.38



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 8

04/30/2004
CWP-1120044

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$184.38NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$170.00NEW SERVICES:
$439.65PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $9.88

CURRENT BALANCE:
$179.88TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$435.15



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 9

04/30/2004
CWP-03110149

AURORA FOODS - FROZENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $88.36

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 47.6204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 9.0004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 56.62

$56.62NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$88.36PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$31.74



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 10

04/30/2004
CWP-03110155

BEST FOODSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $229.87

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 167.4504/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 6.6104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 174.06

$174.06NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$229.87PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$55.81



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 11

04/30/2004
CWP-03110167

COCA COLA - DURANGORE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $516.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 302.3604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 63.4904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 365.85

$365.85NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$516.90PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$151.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 12

04/30/2004
CWP-03110179

COCA COLA - SANTA FERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $111.09

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 67.4504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 67.45

$67.45NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$111.09PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$43.64



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 13

04/30/2004
CWP-03110200

EASTMAN KODAKRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,012.64

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: dismissal, settlement conference; 
Telephone conference with Jill Peterson re: vacating 
hearing. [L234]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 172.2104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 711.6104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 883.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 14

04/30/2004
CWP-03110200

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$883.82NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,012.64PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$164.80



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 15

04/30/2004
CWP-03110218

INTERNATIONAL HOME FOODRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $162.69

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 47.6204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 63.4904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 111.11

$111.11NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$162.69PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$51.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 16

04/30/2004
CWP-03110219

JIMMY DEANRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $521.91

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 319.0204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 60.8404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 379.86

$379.86NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$521.91PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$142.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 17

04/30/2004
CWP-03110227

LIPTONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $849.94

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce and C. Tessman re: amending 
complaint. [L195]

04/20/2004 MCG 0.20

68.00Preparation of extension order; email to opposing 
attorney(s) re: same. [L253]

04/29/2004 CWP 0.40

12.50Left message for D. Bass re: extension of discovery 
deadline. [L217]

04/30/2004 MCG 0.10

25.00Emailed Stipulated order. [L217]04/30/2004 MCG 0.20
87.50Drafted motion to extend time. [L213]04/30/2004 MCG 0.70
68.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: motion to extend 

discovery; Reviewed and revised motion and approve 
for filing. [L253]

04/30/2004 CWP 0.40

Total of New Services: 286.002.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 137.6904/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 600.3604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 738.05



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 18

04/30/2004
CWP-03110227

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce
150.00MCG 1.20 125.00Marisol Garcia

$738.05NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$286.00NEW SERVICES:
$849.94PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $16.62

CURRENT BALANCE:
$302.62TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$414.51



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 19

04/30/2004
CWP-03110236

McNEIL CONSUMER HEALTHCARERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $579.97

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Review claim of release. [L194]04/02/2004 CMT 0.20
45.00Draft and revise letter to J&J re: release. [L193]04/02/2004 CMT 0.30
15.00Review fax from opposing counsel. [L194]04/27/2004 CMT 0.10

Total of New Services: 90.000.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 218.2404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 245.3504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 463.59



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 20

04/30/2004
CWP-03110236

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

90.00CMT 0.60 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$463.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$90.00NEW SERVICES:
$579.97PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $5.23

CURRENT BALANCE:
$95.23TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$211.61



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 21

04/30/2004
CWP-03110239

MEAD JOHNSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $283.05

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 98.4104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 90.2104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 188.62

$188.62NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$283.05PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$94.43



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 22

04/30/2004
CWP-03110242

MINUTE MAIDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $223.52

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

62.50Meeting with C. Tessman re: documents. [L145]04/13/2004 MCG 0.50
312.50Reviewed file and discovery to prepare for trial.  

Preparation of exhibits for trial. [L441]
04/13/2004 MCG 2.50

50.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: exhibits, [L445]04/13/2004 MCG 0.40
437.50Continued preparation of exhibits for trial. [L441]04/14/2004 MCG 3.50
250.00Reviewed source documents and prepared exhibit for 

post petition claim. [L441]
04/14/2004 MCG 2.00

12.50Left message for John Lewis re: deadline to exchange 
exhibits. [L447]

04/14/2004 MCG 0.10

25.00Telephone conference with C. Pierce and J. Lewis re: 
post petition claims. [L447]

04/14/2004 MCG 0.20

25.00Meeting with C. Tessman re: evidence. [L125]04/20/2004 MCG 0.20
125.00Continued preparation of trial exhibits. [L441]04/20/2004 MCG 1.00

Total of New Services: 1,300.0010.40

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 40.4704/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 120.3604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 160.83



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 23

04/30/2004
CWP-03110242

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,300.00MCG 10.40 125.00Marisol Garcia

$160.83NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,300.00NEW SERVICES:
$223.52PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $75.56

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,375.56TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$1,438.25



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 24

04/30/2004
CWP-03110251

NATURAL WEATH VITAMINSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $324.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 59.5204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 201.7004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 261.22

$261.22NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$324.70PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$63.48



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 25

04/30/2004
CWP-03110257

PEYTON MEATSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $201.57

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 35.7104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 96.8204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 132.53

$132.53NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$201.57PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$69.04



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 26

04/30/2004
CWP-03110260

PLAYTEX (WOOLITE)RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $207.64

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 23.8104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 102.5004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 126.31

$126.31NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$207.64PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$81.33



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 27

04/30/2004
CWP-03110263

POMPEIAN INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $249.98

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Review letter from opposing counsel. [L198]04/09/2004 CMT 0.10

Total of New Services: 15.000.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 95.2304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 79.3604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 174.59

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00CMT 0.10 150.00Cynthia Tessman

$174.59NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$15.00NEW SERVICES:
$249.98PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $0.87

CURRENT BALANCE:
$15.87TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$91.26



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 28

04/30/2004
CWP-03110266

QUAKER OATSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $192.45

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 47.6204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 85.3204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 132.94

$132.94NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$192.45PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$59.51



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 29

04/30/2004
CWP-03110269

QUAKER PASTA RONI RICERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $224.19

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 196.4204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 196.42

$196.42NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$224.19PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$27.77



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 30

04/30/2004
CWP-03110278

ROSS LABORATORIESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $459.35

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 133.7204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 237.4204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 371.14

$371.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$459.35PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$88.21



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 31

04/30/2004
CWP-03110281

S.C. JOHNSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $276.29

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 59.5204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 135.3004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 194.82

$194.82NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$276.29PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$81.47



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 32

04/30/2004
CWP-03110290

SEVEN UP / RCRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $398.78

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of email from Tom Walker re: further 
documents on AR claim; email re: settlement. [L163]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 67.4604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 130.6804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 198.14

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$198.14NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$398.78PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$236.62



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 33

04/30/2004
CWP-03110293

SHAMROCK FARMSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $218.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 202.6304/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 202.63

$202.63NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$218.50PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$15.87



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 34

04/30/2004
CWP-03110308

TROPICANARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $210.30

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 67.4604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 84.6504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 152.11

$152.11NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$210.30PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$58.19



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 35

04/30/2004
CWP-03110311

UNILEVERRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $200.38

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 35.7104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 117.0504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 152.76

$152.76NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$200.38PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$47.62



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 36

04/30/2004
CWP-03110317

WHITEHALL-ROBBINSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $363.72

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 23.8104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 288.3404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 312.15

$312.15NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$363.72PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$51.57

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037 BILLING DATE:

PAGE 1

CLIENT SUMMARY

04/30/2004

Account Previous Balance Payments Current BalanceCharges

GONZALES V. ADVO, INC.
969.791,693.033010237 903.12179.88

GONZALES V. BRINKS INCORPORATED
1,398.851,583.503010243 426.96242.31

GONZALES V. CHARLES L. HENRY
4,786.966,754.283010245 4,650.932,683.61

GONZALES V. COREMARK
77.5191.003010246 229.35215.86

GONZALES V. CUSTOMCRAFT 
FIXTURES

852.061,116.583010249 444.40179.88

GONZALES V. CIT GROUP
573.25618.223010250 44.970.00

GONZALES V. EDISON SOURCE
491.24549.703010253 94.4435.98

GONZALES V. EL PASO TIMES
853.921,055.223010257 201.300.00

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL BUSINESS
941.99943.313010263 1.320.00

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL CORP.
861.841,198.063010264 336.220.00

GONZALES V. HEWLETT PACKARD
684.61858.673010267 611.07437.01



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 2

04/30/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. HUBERT CO.
385.16572.983010269 187.820.00

GONZALES V. HW SINGLETON CO. INC.
579.85915.023010271 479.08143.91

GONZALES V. IMPACT EVENTS
991.481,306.543010273 929.83614.77

GONZALES V. JAN FRIEDERICH
2,490.824,053.403010275 2,046.14483.56

GONZALES V. JLS SECURITY PATROL
594.151,196.753010277 638.5835.98

GONZALES V. NETCOM MANAGEMENT 
GROUP

325.64352.633010283 26.990.00

GONZALES V. NETWORK ARCHITECHS
2,447.972,567.283010290 155.2935.98

GONZALES V. PRODUCTIVE DATA
1,461.821,811.263010297 433.0383.59

GONZALES V. QUALEX
2,781.812,969.643010298 187.830.00

GONZALES V. QWEST
872.411,055.733010299 219.3035.98

GONZALES V. STAMPS ON 
CONSIGNMENT

0.000.003010300 269.82269.82

GONZALES V. RICHARDSON & 
RICHARDSON

2,346.323,241.503010301 1,047.55152.37



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 3

04/30/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. RUBBAIR DOOR
1,367.881,492.213010302 124.330.00

GONZALES V. SANTA FE NEW 
MEXICAN

1,662.431,782.013010303 155.5635.98

GONZALES V. SITRICK & CO.
4,849.127,511.753010304 3,567.92905.29

GONZALES V. SAS INSTITUTE
553.51670.953010305 376.68259.24

GONZALES V. SPECS REFRIGERATION
1,084.081,932.433010306 2,053.551,205.20

GONZALES V. TOM DAHLEN
1,573.692,028.173010308 542.3087.82

GONZALES V. TOTAL CONTROL
769.26995.043010309 858.01632.23

GONZALES V. TOTE CART COMPANY
545.46654.203010311 440.99332.25

GONZALES V. WINDWARD
1,322.652,454.593010318 1,291.72159.78

9,448.28 41,497.53 23,976.4056,025.65Totals:



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 4

04/30/2004
CWP-3010237

GONZALES V. ADVO, INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,693.03

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of signed settlement agreement; mail to 
opposing attorney(s). [L167]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status of 
payments. [L234]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20
34.00Review of emails from opposing attorney(s) re: status 

conference; email opposing attorney(s) re: same. 
[L237]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of email from opposing attorney(s) re: Furr's 
W-9. [L164]

04/26/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 170.001.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 280.1404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 689.6504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 969.79



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 5

04/30/2004
CWP-3010237

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$969.79NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$170.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,693.03PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $9.88

CURRENT BALANCE:
$179.88TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$903.12



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 6

04/30/2004
CWP-3010243

GONZALES V. BRINKS INCORPORATEDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,583.50

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Telephone conference with Mac McMahan. [L198]04/13/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Draft e-mail to McMahan re: order. [L258]04/13/2004 CMT 0.20
75.00Draft order. [L253]04/13/2004 CMT 0.50
30.00E-mail opposing counsel re: order approving 

settlement. [L258]
04/26/2004 CMT 0.20

15.00Review e-mail approving order. [L258]04/26/2004 CMT 0.10
15.00Review fax from opposing counsel re: check. [L198]04/26/2004 CMT 0.10
34.00Review of order approving settlement. [L164]04/28/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 229.001.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 276.9604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,121.8904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,398.85



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 7

04/30/2004
CWP-3010243

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

195.00CMT 1.30 150.00Cynthia Tessman
34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,398.85NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$229.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,583.50PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $13.31

CURRENT BALANCE:
$242.31TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$426.96



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 8

04/30/2004
CWP-3010245

GONZALES V. CHARLES L. HENRYRE:
ARCHITECTS

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $6,754.28

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conference with Joe Jameson re: 
corrections, transcript. [L338]

04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

170.00Review of transcript of deposition of defendant, 
Rachel Kefauver. [L334]

04/07/2004 CWP 1.00

68.00Review of deposition of Charles Henry; Telephone 
conference with Anne Goodman re: motion for 
summary judgment. [L334]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.40

30.00Status conference with Chris Pierce. [L125]04/27/2004 ADG 0.20
30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding motion for 

summary judgment. [L245]
04/28/2004 ADG 0.20

240.00Review file, depositions of defendant and Rachel 
Kefauver. [L244]

04/28/2004 ADG 1.60

390.00Work on draft summary judgment motion. [L243]04/28/2004 ADG 2.60
120.00Research for summary judgment motion. [L242]04/29/2004 ADG 0.80
420.00Draft and edit motion for summary judgment. [L243]04/29/2004 ADG 2.80

30.00Telephone conference with Tom Walker regarding 
Caplan affidavit. [L247]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.20

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding analysis for 
motion. [L245]

04/29/2004 ADG 0.20

15.00Review e-mail from Tom Walker regarding box 
inventory numbers for financial statements. [L247]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.10

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding witness list. 
[L445]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.20

165.00Review depositions, prepare final witness list. [L443]04/30/2004 ADG 1.10
75.00Review insolvency-related documents. [L244]04/30/2004 ADG 0.50

225.00Revise motion for summary judgment. [L243]04/30/2004 ADG 1.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 9

04/30/2004
CWP-3010245

30.00Conference with Chris Pierce regarding exhibits to 
motion. [L245]

04/30/2004 ADG 0.20

51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: summary 
judgment, motion, exhibits, proof, affidavits, 
insolvency. [L245]

04/30/2004 CWP 0.30

102.00Reviewed and revised witness list; Conference with 
Anne Goodman re: same; Preparation for filing of 
same. [L413]

04/30/2004 CWP 0.60

Total of New Services: 2,255.0014.70

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
297.54Court Reporter Fee - Deposition of C. Henry, R. 

Kefauver taken on March 18, 2004. [E115]
04/09/2004

Total of New Expenses: 297.54

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 3,295.7904/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,491.1704/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 4,786.96



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 10

04/30/2004
CWP-3010245

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,830.00ADG 12.20 150.00Anne Goodman
425.00CWP 2.50 170.00Chris Pierce

$4,786.96NEW PAYMENTS:
$297.54NEW EXPENSES:

$2,255.00NEW SERVICES:
$6,754.28PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $131.07

CURRENT BALANCE:
$2,683.61TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$4,650.93



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 11

04/30/2004
CWP-3010246

GONZALES V. COREMARKRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $91.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

204.00Review of file, documents, discovery responses re: 
settlement; Preparation of letter to opposing 
attorney(s) re: same. [L163]

04/16/2004 CWP 1.20

Total of New Services: 204.001.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 77.5104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 77.51

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

204.00CWP 1.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$77.51NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$204.00NEW SERVICES:
$91.00PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $11.86

CURRENT BALANCE:
$215.86TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$229.35



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 12

04/30/2004
CWP-3010249

GONZALES V. CUSTOMCRAFT FIXTURESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,116.58

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
settlement, experts. [L348]

04/07/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
response; Conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
same. [L348]

04/16/2004 CWP 0.30

51.00Reviewed and revised order on scheduling; email to 
court. [L433]

04/16/2004 CWP 0.30

34.00Review of filed calendaring order; Review of file re: 
settlement status. [L433]

04/21/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 170.001.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 277.7604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 574.3004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 852.06



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 13

04/30/2004
CWP-3010249

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce

$852.06NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$170.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,116.58PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $9.88

CURRENT BALANCE:
$179.88TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$444.40



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 14

04/30/2004
CWP-3010250

GONZALES V. CIT GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $618.22

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 573.2504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 573.25

$573.25NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$618.22PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$44.97



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 15

04/30/2004
CWP-3010253

GONZALES V. EDISON SOURCERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $549.70

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: dismissal, settlement conference; 
Telephone conference with Jill Peterson re: vacating 
hearing. [L234]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 121.4204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 369.8204/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 491.24



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 16

04/30/2004
CWP-3010253

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$491.24NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$549.70PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$94.44



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 17

04/30/2004
CWP-3010257

GONZALES V. EL PASO TIMESRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,055.22

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 281.7304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 572.1904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 853.92

$853.92NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,055.22PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$201.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 18

04/30/2004
CWP-3010263

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL BUSINESSRE:
ASSET

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $943.31

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 941.9904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 941.99

$941.99NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$943.31PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$1.32



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 19

04/30/2004
CWP-3010264

GONZALES V. GE CAPITAL CORP.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,198.06

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 861.8404/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 861.84

$861.84NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,198.06PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$336.22



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 20

04/30/2004
CWP-3010267

GONZALES V. HEWLETT PACKARDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $858.67

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

30.00Meet with Turner re: settlement. [L168]04/06/2004 CMT 0.20
30.00Review requested changes to settlement. [L163]04/06/2004 CMT 0.20
75.00Begin revisions to settlement agreement. [L163]04/06/2004 CMT 0.50
34.00Review of memo from Cynthia Tessman re: status 

conference. [L234]
04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20
30.00Telephone conference with Turner re: settlement. 

[L168]
04/09/2004 CMT 0.20

30.00Telephone conference with Turner re: settlement. 
[L198]

04/23/2004 CMT 0.20

45.00Meet with CWP re: settlement. [L198]04/23/2004 CMT 0.30
45.00Telephone conference with Turner re: changes to 

settlement agreement. [L198]
04/23/2004 CMT 0.30

15.00Review fax from Turner. [L198]04/23/2004 CMT 0.10
30.00Review e-mail from Turner. [L198]04/23/2004 CMT 0.20
15.00Telephone conference with Turner. [L198]04/23/2004 CMT 0.10

Total of New Services: 413.002.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 295.2204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 389.3904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 684.61



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 21

04/30/2004
CWP-3010267

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

345.00CMT 2.30 150.00Cynthia Tessman
68.00CWP 0.40 170.00Chris Pierce

$684.61NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$413.00NEW SERVICES:
$858.67PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $24.01

CURRENT BALANCE:
$437.01TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$611.07



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 22

04/30/2004
CWP-3010269

GONZALES V. HUBERT CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $572.98

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 26.9804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 358.1804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 385.16

$385.16NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$572.98PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$187.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 23

04/30/2004
CWP-3010271

GONZALES V. HW SINGLETON CO. INC.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $915.02

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of pro hac documents; Review of proposed 
order, notice of hearing. [L444]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of signed order granting pro hac motion; 
Review of file re: status of hearing, settlement. 
[L444]

04/07/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Review of request to appear telephonically from 
opposing attorney(s); approve for faxing to court. 
[L444]

04/08/2004 CWP 0.20

34.00Appearance by telephone at hearing. [L239]04/09/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 136.000.80

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 266.6504/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 313.2004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 579.85



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 24

04/30/2004
CWP-3010271

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

136.00CWP 0.80 170.00Chris Pierce

$579.85NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$136.00NEW SERVICES:
$915.02PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $7.91

CURRENT BALANCE:
$143.91TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$479.08



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 25

04/30/2004
CWP-3010273

GONZALES V. IMPACT EVENTSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,306.54

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

75.00Analyze for MSJ. [L244]04/08/2004 CMT 0.50
45.00Research factor issue. [L122]04/08/2004 CMT 0.30
30.00Review witness list re: deadline to file anticipated 

witness list. [L253]
04/14/2004 CMT 0.20

187.00Review of file, answer, discovery re: factor 
agreement, defenses; Legal research for same. [L334]

04/16/2004 CWP 1.10

45.00Telephone conference with Mullen re: status of case 
and settlement. [L168]

04/16/2004 CMT 0.30

30.00Telephone conference with Judge's office re: hearing 
dates. [L198]

04/29/2004 CMT 0.20

75.00Draft Amended PTO. [L433]04/29/2004 CMT 0.50
45.00Update memo re: status. [L143]04/29/2004 CMT 0.30
15.00Meet with CWP re: status of hearing dates. [L195]04/29/2004 CMT 0.10
34.00Review of fax from opposing attorney(s) approving 

scheduling order; Reviewed and revised same and 
email to Court. [L253]

04/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 581.003.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 495.2004/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 496.2804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 991.48



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 26

04/30/2004
CWP-3010273

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

360.00CMT 2.40 150.00Cynthia Tessman
221.00CWP 1.30 170.00Chris Pierce

$991.48NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$581.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,306.54PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $33.77

CURRENT BALANCE:
$614.77TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$929.83



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 27

04/30/2004
CWP-3010275

GONZALES V. JAN FRIEDERICHRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $4,053.40

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Conference with Paul Barber regarding argument on 
amended complaint motion. [L125]

04/08/2004 ADG 0.10

442.00Preparing for and appearing at hearing re motion to 
amend and motion for summary judgment. [L241]

04/08/2004 PDB 2.60

Total of New Services: 457.002.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 1,008.6604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,482.1604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,490.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 28

04/30/2004
CWP-3010275

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00ADG 0.10 150.00Anne Goodman
442.00PDB 2.60 170.00Paul Barber

$2,490.82NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$457.00NEW SERVICES:
$4,053.40PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $26.56

CURRENT BALANCE:
$483.56TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$2,046.14



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 29

04/30/2004
CWP-3010277

GONZALES V. JLS SECURITY PATROLRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,196.75

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of notice of bankruptcy. [L114]04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 594.1504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 594.15

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$594.15NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,196.75PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$638.58



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 30

04/30/2004
CWP-3010283

GONZALES V. NETCOM MANAGEMENT GROUPRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $352.63

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 26.9804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 298.6604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 325.64

$325.64NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$352.63PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$26.99



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 31

04/30/2004
CWP-3010290

GONZALES V. NETWORK ARCHITECHSRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,567.28

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of check; Letter to Yvette Gonzales. [L163]04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 26.9804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,420.9904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,447.97

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$2,447.97NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,567.28PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$155.29



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 32

04/30/2004
CWP-3010297

GONZALES V. PRODUCTIVE DATARE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,811.26

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Review status. [L164]04/02/2004 ADG 0.10
34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 

settlement, approval of orders. [L167]
04/05/2004 CWP 0.20

30.00Review status of settlement. [L164]04/29/2004 ADG 0.20

Total of New Services: 79.000.50

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 713.4404/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 748.3804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,461.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 33

04/30/2004
CWP-3010297

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

45.00ADG 0.30 150.00Anne Goodman
34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,461.82NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$79.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,811.26PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.59

CURRENT BALANCE:
$83.59TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$433.03



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 34

04/30/2004
CWP-3010298

GONZALES V. QUALEXRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,969.64

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 115.8604/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 2,665.9504/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,781.81

$2,781.81NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$2,969.64PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$187.83



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 35

04/30/2004
CWP-3010299

GONZALES V. QWESTRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,055.73

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of motion to approve compromise filed by 
Tom Walker. [L164]

04/06/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 319.8204/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 552.5904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 872.41

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$872.41NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,055.73PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$219.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 36

04/30/2004
CWP-3010300

GONZALES V. STAMPS ON CONSIGNMENTRE:
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Conferring with Mr. Pierce re Furr's/U.S. Postal case 
discussed at hearing. [L195]

04/13/2004 PDB 0.30

34.00Reviewing correspondence re U.S. postal /Furr's. 
[L194]

04/16/2004 PDB 0.20

34.00Email to David Thuma re: Stamps for Less/Amplex 
case. [L197]

04/20/2004 CWP 0.20

136.00Conference with David Thuma re: entry of 
appearance, substitution as counsel in this case; 
Preparation of entry of appearance and approve for 
filing; Review of email from David Thuma, 
pleadings. [L194]

04/26/2004 CWP 0.80

Total of New Services: 255.001.50



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 37

04/30/2004
CWP-3010300

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce
85.00PDB 0.50 170.00Paul Barber

$0.00NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$255.00NEW SERVICES:
$0.00PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $14.82

CURRENT BALANCE:
$269.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$269.82



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 38

04/30/2004
CWP-3010301

GONZALES V. RICHARDSON & RICHARDSONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $3,241.50

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
hearing, postponement. [L457]

04/08/2004 CWP 0.20

51.00Conference with Judge's clerk re: hearing date; 
Preparation of order and email to court. [L443]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.30

25.00Prepare Stipulated Order Rescheduled Status 
Conference. [L143]

04/09/2004 JG 0.50

34.00Telephone conference with opposing attorney(s) re: 
vacating hearing; Revision to order and email to 
Court. [L254]

04/12/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 144.001.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 350.7704/27/2004
Payment on March 2004 statement (expenses). 286.5504/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,709.0004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 2,346.32



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 39

04/30/2004
CWP-3010301

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

119.00CWP 0.70 170.00Chris Pierce
25.00JG 0.50 50.00Jina Garcia

$2,346.32NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$144.00NEW SERVICES:
$3,241.50PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.37

CURRENT BALANCE:
$152.37TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,047.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 40

04/30/2004
CWP-3010302

GONZALES V. RUBBAIR DOORRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,492.21

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,367.8804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,367.88

$1,367.88NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:
$0.00NEW SERVICES:

$1,492.21PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

CURRENT BALANCE:
$0.00TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$124.33



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 41

04/30/2004
CWP-3010303

GONZALES V. SANTA FE NEW MEXICANRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,782.01

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

34.00Review of file re: dismissal, status conference; 
Telephone conference with Jill Peterson re: vacating 
hearing. [L234]

04/02/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 34.000.20

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 154.3504/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,508.0804/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,662.43



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 42

04/30/2004
CWP-3010303

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

34.00CWP 0.20 170.00Chris Pierce

$1,662.43NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$34.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,782.01PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $1.98

CURRENT BALANCE:
$35.98TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$155.56



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 43

04/30/2004
CWP-3010304

GONZALES V. SITRICK & CO.RE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $7,511.75

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

102.00Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel; 
telephone call to opposing counsel; conferring with 
courtroom deputy; [L338]

04/06/2004 PDB 0.60

136.00Multiple telephone calls to opposing counsel; 
preparing pleadings. [L337]

04/07/2004 PDB 0.80

25.00Prepared  draft of Third Stipulated Order Extending 
Deadlines Contained in Stipulated Order in Lieu of 
Scheduling Conference. [L143]

04/09/2004 RB 0.50

Total of New Services: 263.001.90

DATE EXPENSE AMOUNT
627.00Court Reporter Fee - Deposition of Michael Sitrick 

on 03/11/04.
04/13/2004

Total of New Expenses: 627.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 3,998.1304/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 850.9904/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 4,849.12



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 44

04/30/2004
CWP-3010304

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

238.00PDB 1.40 170.00Paul Barber
25.00RB 0.50 50.00Renee Baca

$4,849.12NEW PAYMENTS:
$627.00NEW EXPENSES:
$263.00NEW SERVICES:

$7,511.75PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $15.29

CURRENT BALANCE:
$905.29TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$3,567.92



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 45

04/30/2004
CWP-3010305

GONZALES V. SAS INSTITUTERE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $670.95

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: status. [L195]04/30/2004 MCG 0.20
25.00Telephone conference with Scott Turner re: status. 

[L197]
04/30/2004 MCG 0.20

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: payment returned and 
memo regarding remaining claim. [L195]

04/30/2004 MCG 0.20

170.00Conference with Marisol Garcia re: settlement, 
dismissal; Review of file re: same; Preparation of 
memo to Yvette Gonzales; Conference with Marisol 
Garcia re: overpayment, status; email memo to Yvette 
Gonzales; Review of response. [L163]

04/30/2004 CWP 1.00

Total of New Services: 245.001.60

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 23.8104/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 529.7004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 553.51



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 46

04/30/2004
CWP-3010305

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

170.00CWP 1.00 170.00Chris Pierce
75.00MCG 0.60 125.00Marisol Garcia

$553.51NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$245.00NEW SERVICES:
$670.95PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $14.24

CURRENT BALANCE:
$259.24TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$376.68



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 47

04/30/2004
CWP-3010306

GONZALES V. SPECS REFRIGERATIONRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $1,932.43

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

102.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 
preparing for trial. [L447]

04/26/2004 PDB 0.60

612.00Preparing for trial; reviewing file; reviewing 
correspondence from accountant; preparing 
correspondence to opposing counsel; telephone 
conversation with opposing counsel. [L441]

04/27/2004 PDB 3.60

425.00Reviewing exhibits and correspondence from 
opposing counsel; preparing correspondence to 
accountant; telephone conversation with client; 
telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 
telephone conversation with courtroom deputy; 
telephone conversation with witnesses. [L441]

04/28/2004 PDB 2.50

Total of New Services: 1,139.006.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 40.4704/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,043.6104/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,084.08



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 48

04/30/2004
CWP-3010306

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

1,139.00PDB 6.70 170.00Paul Barber

$1,084.08NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$1,139.00NEW SERVICES:
$1,932.43PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $66.20

CURRENT BALANCE:
$1,205.20TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$2,053.55



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 49

04/30/2004
CWP-3010308

GONZALES V. TOM DAHLENRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,028.17

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Preparation of stipulation of dismissal. [L143]04/02/2004 KW 0.30
68.00Conferring with courtroom deputy; conferring with 

legal assistant. [L168]
04/06/2004 PDB 0.40

Total of New Services: 83.000.70

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 285.6904/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,288.0004/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,573.69



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 50

04/30/2004
CWP-3010308

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00KW 0.30 50.00Kimberlee White
68.00PDB 0.40 170.00Paul Barber

$1,573.69NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$83.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,028.17PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $4.82

CURRENT BALANCE:
$87.82TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$542.30



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 51

04/30/2004
CWP-3010309

GONZALES V. TOTAL CONTROLRE:
INFORMATION

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $995.04

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

51.00Review of file re: status, settlement, discovery; Left 
message with opposing attorney(s) re: same. [L114]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.30

25.00Prepared Stipulated Order Resulting From Final 
Pretrial Conference. [L143]

04/08/2004 RB 0.50

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: final pretrial order and 
trial setting. [L145]

04/08/2004 MCG 0.20

37.50Determined deadlines for Final Pretrial Order. [L213]04/08/2004 MCG 0.30
51.00Review of message from opposing attorney(s)' office 

re: unavailability for hearing; Review of memo from 
Cynthia Tessman re: same; Appearance by telephone 
at hearing. [L239]

04/09/2004 CWP 0.30

204.00Review of defenses, documents; Legal research for 
ordinary course defense; Review of checks, FedEd 
and wire transfer records. [L114]

04/16/2004 CWP 1.20

170.00Review of letter from opposing attorney(s) 
responding to settlement offer; Review of signed 
order on scheduling; Reviewed and revised order; 
email to court; Review of file re: settlement offer, 
status, discovery. [L164]

04/28/2004 CWP 1.00

34.00Review of signed scheduling order. [L194]04/30/2004 CWP 0.20

Total of New Services: 597.504.00

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 161.5004/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 607.7604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 769.26



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 52

04/30/2004
CWP-3010309

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

510.00CWP 3.00 170.00Chris Pierce
62.50MCG 0.50 125.00Marisol Garcia
25.00RB 0.50 50.00Renee Baca

$769.26NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$597.50NEW SERVICES:
$995.04PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $34.73

CURRENT BALANCE:
$632.23TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$858.01



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 53

04/30/2004
CWP-3010311

GONZALES V. TOTE CART COMPANYRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $654.20

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

85.00Review of file re: trial, settlement; Telephone 
conference with opposing attorney(s) re: same; 
Conference with Marisol Garcia re: order, trial. 
[L127]

04/01/2004 CWP 0.50

25.00Meeting with C. Pierce re: trial date and status of 
order. [L165]

04/01/2004 MCG 0.20

51.00Conference with Anne Goodman re: settlement, 
status; Telephone conference with opposing 
attorney(s) re: same. [L167]

04/13/2004 CWP 0.30

153.00Review of file re: settlement, trial, status, defenses; 
Review of exhibits, spreadsheets; Review of case 
law. [L114]

04/29/2004 CWP 0.90

Total of New Services: 314.001.90

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 86.5004/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 458.9604/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 545.46



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 54

04/30/2004
CWP-3010311

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

289.00CWP 1.70 170.00Chris Pierce
25.00MCG 0.20 125.00Marisol Garcia

$545.46NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$314.00NEW SERVICES:
$654.20PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $18.25

CURRENT BALANCE:
$332.25TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:
$440.99



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 55

04/30/2004
CWP-3010318

GONZALES V. WINDWARDRE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE:     $2,454.59

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDEREDDATE INDIV AMOUNTTIME

15.00Preparation of stipulation of dismissal. [L143]04/02/2004 KW 0.30
136.00Telephone conversation with opposing counsel; 

preparing pleadings. [L168]
04/06/2004 PDB 0.80

Total of New Services: 151.001.10

DATE PAYMENT AMOUNT

Payment on March 2004 statement. 150.7804/27/2004
Payment on 04/15/04 Fee Application Order. 1,171.8704/28/2004

Total of New Payments: 1,322.65



DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.
Attorneys and Counselors at Law

201 Broadway Blvd. SE, Albuquerque, NM 87102
P.O. Box  6, Albuquerque, NM  87103

Telephone (505)243-6129  Telefax (505)247-3185

YVETTE J. GONZALES, TRUSTEE

PLACITAS, NM 87043-1037
P.O. BOX 1037

ACC'T NO.:
BILLING DATE:
PAGE 56

04/30/2004
CWP-3010318

AmountTimeIndiv.

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

Timekeeper Effective Rate

15.00KW 0.30 50.00Kimberlee White
136.00PDB 0.80 170.00Paul Barber

$1,322.65NEW PAYMENTS:
$0.00NEW EXPENSES:

$151.00NEW SERVICES:
$2,454.59PREVIOUS BALANCE:

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

TAX: $8.78

CURRENT BALANCE:
$159.78TOT. CURRENT PERIOD:

$1,291.72

Please write your account number on your check and make payable to
DAVIS & PIERCE, P.C.  Mail to P.O. BOX 6, ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87103


